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CORKSCREW FARMS
COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT DISTRICT AGENDA
FRIDAY, JANUARY 20, 2017
1:00 P.M.

The Place at Corkscrew
Located at 4954 Royal Gulf Circle, Fort Myers FL 33966

District Board of Supervisors Chairman Joseph Cameratta
Vice Chairman Anthony Cameratta
Supervisor Laura Youmans
Supervisor Cheryl Yano
Supervisor Vacant

District Manager Meritus Brian Lamb

District Attorney Coleman, Yovanovich & Koester, PA  Greg Urbancic

District Engineer Barraco & Associates Carl A. Barraco

All cellular phones and pagers must be turned off while in the meeting room

The District Agenda is comprised of four different sections:

The meeting will begin at 1:00 P.M. with the second section called Public Comments on Agenda Items. If any member
of the audience would like to speak on one of the agenda items, they will need to register with the District Administrator
prior to the presentation of that agenda item. Agendas can be reviewed by contacting the Manager’s office at (813) 397-
5120 at least seven days in advance of the scheduled meeting. Requests to place items on the agenda must be submitted
in writing with an explanation to the District Manager at least fourteen (14) days prior to the date of the meeting. The
third section is called Business Administrative. The business administrative section contains items for approval by the
District Board of Supervisors that may require discussion, motion and votes on an item-by-item basis. The fourth section
is called Consent Agenda. The Consent Agenda section contains items that require the review and approval of the
District Board of Supervisors as a normal course of business. The fifth section is called Staff Reports. This section
allows the District Administrator, Engineer, and Attorney to update the Board of Supervisors on any pending issues that
are being researched for Board action. The final sections are called Supervisor Requests and Audience Comments.
This is the section in which the Supervisors may request Staff to prepare certain items in an effort to meet residential
needs. The Audience Comment portion of the agenda is where individuals may comment on matters that concern the
District. Each individual is limited to three (3) minutes for such comment. The Board of Supervisors or Staff is not
obligated to provide a response until sufficient time for research or action is warranted. IF THE COMMENT
CONCERNS A MAINTENANCE RELATED ITEM, THE ITEM WILL NEED TO BE ADDRESSED BY THE
DISTRICT ADMINSTRATOR OUTSIDE THE CONTEXT OF THIS MEETING.

Public workshops sessions may be advertised and held in an effort to provide informational services. These sessions allow
staff or consultants to discuss a policy or business matter in a more informal manner and allow for lengthy presentations
prior to scheduling the item for approval. Typically no motions or votes are made during these sessions.

Pursuant to provisions of the Americans with Disabilities Act, any person requiring special accommodations to participate
in this meeting is asked to advise the District Office at (813) 397-5120, at least 48 hours before the meeting. If you are
hearing or speech impaired, please contact the Florida Relay Service at 1 (800) 955-8770, who can aid you in contacting
the District Office.

Any person who decides to appeal any decision made by the Board with respect to any matter considered at the meeting is
advised that this same person will need a record of the proceedings and that accordingly, the person may need to ensure
that a verbatim record of the proceedings is made, including the testimony and evidence upon which the appeal is to be
based.
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Board of Supervisors
Corkscrew Farms Community Development District

Dear Board Members:

The Regular Meeting and Public Hearing of Corkscrew Farms Community Development District will be held on January
20, 2017 at 1:00 P.M. at The Place at Corkscrew located at 4654 Royal Gulf Circle Fort Myers, FL 33966. Following is
the Agenda for the Meeting:

N

S

7.

Call In Number: 1-866-906-9330 Access Code: 4863181

CALL TO ORDER/ROLL CALL
PUBLIC COMMENT ON AGENDA ITEMS
BUSINESS ADMINISTRATIVE

A. Consideration of Resolution 2017-01; Amending Fiscal Year 2017 Budget...........ccooevvrieneinniennnns Tab 01
B. Consideration of Resolution 2017-02; Acceptance of Responsibility for Ownership,

Operation and MaINTENANCE. .. ... ...t ettt e e e e et et e e e e e e e e e Tab 02
C. General Matters of the District
CONSENT AGENDA
A. Consideration of Board of Supervisors Special Meeting Minutes September 07, 2016................. Tab 03
B. Consideration of Board of Supervisors Regular & Public Hearing Meeting Minutes Sept. 16, 2016.Tab 04
C. Consideration of Operations and Maintenance Expenditures January 2017.............cccooivivienn.n. Tab 05
D. Construction Fund Requisition RatifiCatioN.............c.uii oo e e e e Tab 06
E. Review of Financial Statements Month Ending November 30, 2016............ccocviie i iiiiininnenen Tab 07

STAFF REPORTS
A. District Counsel
B. District Engineer
C. District Manager
SUPERVISOR REQUESTS AND AUDIENCE COMMENTS
ADJOURNMENT

We look forward to seeing you at the meeting. In the meantime, if you have any questions, please do not hesitate to call
us at (813) 397-5120.



RESOLUTION 2017-01

A RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF
CORKSCREW FARMS COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT
DISTRICT AMENDING THE FISCAL YEAR 2016/2017
GENERAL FUND BUDGET; PROVIDING A SEVERABILITY
CLAUSE; AND PROVIDING AN EFFECTIVE DATE.

WHEREAS, Corkscrew Farms Community Development District (the “District”) is a local
unit of special-purpose government established and existing pursuant to Chapter 190, Florida Statutes,
being situated entirely within Lee County, Florida; and

WHEREAS, the Board of Supervisors of the District (the “Board”) adopted a General Fund
Budget for Fiscal Year 2016/2017; and

WHEREAS, the Board desires to reallocate funds budgeted to reflect re-appropriated revenues
and expenses approved during the Fiscal Year.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF
CORKSCREW FARMS COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT DISTRICT;

SECTION 1. The General Fund Budget for Fiscal Year 2016/2017 is hereby amended in
accordance with Exhibit “A” attached hereto and made a part hereof.

SECTION 2. In accordance with Section 189.016, Florida Statutes, the amended budget
shall be posted on the District’s official website within five (5) days after adoption.

SECTION 3: The invalidity or unenforceability of any one or more provisions of this
Resolution shall not affect the validity or enforceability of the remaining portions of this Resolution,
or any part thereof.

SECTION 4: This Resolution shall take effect upon its passage and adoption by the Board.

PASSED AND ADOPTED THIS 20" DAY OF JANUARY, 2017.

CORKSCREW FARMS COMMUNITY
DEVELOPMENT DISTRICT

ATTEST:

Brian Lamb, Secretary Joseph Cameratta, Chairman
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CORKSCREW FARMS

COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT DISTRICT

BUDGET INTRODUCTION

Background Information

The Corkscrew Farms Community Development District is a local special purpose
government authorized by Chapter 190, Florida Statutes, as amended. The Community
Development District (CDD) is an alternative method for planning, financing, acquiring,
operating and maintaining community-wide infrastructure in master planned
communities. The CDD also is a mechanism that provides a “solution” to the State’s needs
for delivery of capital infrastructure to service projected growth without overburdening
other governments and their taxpayers. CDDs represent a major advancement in Florida’s
effort to manage its growth effectively and efficiently. This allows the community to set a
higher standard for construction along with providing a long-term solution to the
operation and maintenance of community facilities.

The following report represents the District budget for Fiscal Year 2017, which begins on
October 1, 2016. The District budget is organized by fund to segregate financial resources
and ensure that the segregated resources are used for their intended purpose, and the
District has established the following funds.

Fund Number Fund Name Services Provided
001 General Fund Operations and Maintenance of
Community Facilities Financed by

Non-Ad Valorem Assessments

200 Debt Service Fund Collection of Special Assessments
for Debt Service on the Series 2016
Capital Improvement Revenue
Bonds

Facilities of the District

The District’s facilities will include drainage & surface water management system, on-site
roadways, off-site utilities and roadway improvements, on-site utilities, professional fees
and environmental & wildlife restoration and mitigation and other related public
improvements.

Maintenance of the Facilities

In order to maintain the facilities, the District conducts hearings to adopt an operating
budget each year. This budget includes a detailed description of the maintenance program
along with an estimate of the cost of the program. The funding of the maintenance budget
is levied as a non-ad valorem assessment on your property by the District Board of
Supervisors.

-1-




CORKSCREW FARMS

COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT DISTRICT

Fiscal Year 2017 Proposed Increase / (Decrease) from

Operating Budget FY 2016 to FY 2017
REVENUES
SPECIAL ASSESSMENTS
Operations & Maintenance Assmts-Tax Roll 0.00 0.00
Operations & Maintenance Assmts-Off Roll 197,585.11 104,375.11
Discounts and Collection Fees (104,375.11) (104,375.11)
TOTAL SPECIAL ASSESSMENTS 93,210.00 0.00
TOTAL REVENUES $93,210.00 $0.00
EXPENDITURES
FINANCIAL & ADMINISTRATIVE
District Manager 34,000.00 0.00
Trustees Fees 8,000.00 0.00
Auditing Services 5,500.00 0.00
Postage, Phone, Faxes, Copies 150.00 0.00
Public Officials Insurance 2,500.00 0.00
Bank Fees 300.00 0.00
Dues, Licenses & Fees 260.00 0.00
District Engineer 12,500.00 0.00
TOTAL FINANCIAL & ADMINISTRATIVE 63,210.00 0.00
LEGAL COUNSEL
District Counsel 12,500.00 0.00
TOTAL LEGAL COUNSEL 12,500.00 0.00
OTHER PHYSICAL ENVIRONMENT
Property & Casualty Insurance 15,000.00 0.00
TOTAL OTHER PHYSICAL ENVIRONMENT 15,000.00 0.00
RESERVES
Undesignated Reserve 2,500.00 0.00
TOTAL RESERVES 2,500.00 0.00
TOTAL EXPENDITURES $93,210.00 $0.00
EXCESS OF REVENUES OVER (UNDER) EXPENDITURES $0.00 $0.00

FISCAL YEAR 2017
AMENDED ANNUAL

OPERATING BUDGET



CORKSCREW FARMS

COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT DISTRICT
GENERAL FUND 001

Financial & Administrative
District Manager

The District retains the services of a consulting manager, who is responsible for the daily
administration of the District's business, including any and all financial work related to the
Bond Funds and Operating Funds of the District, and preparation of the minutes of the Board of
Supervisors. In addition, the District Manager prepares the Annual Budget(s), implements all
policies of the Board of Supervisors, and attends all meetings of the Board of Supervisors.

District Engineer
Consists of attendance at scheduled meetings of the Board of Supervisors, offering advice and
consultation on all matters related to the works of the District, such as bids for yearly contracts,
operating policy, compliance with regulatory permits, etc.

Disclosure Reporting

On a quarterly and annual basis, disclosure of relevant district information is provided to the
Muni Council, as required within the bond indentures.

Trustees Fees
This item relates to the fee assessed for the annual administration of bonds outstanding, as
required within the bond indentures.

Auditing Services

The District is required to annually undertake an independent examination of its books, records
and accounting procedures. This audit is conducted pursuant to State Law and the Rules of the
Auditor General.

Postage, Phone, Fax, Copies
This item refers to the cost of materials and service to produce agendas and conduct day-to-day
business of the District.

Miscellaneous Administration
This is required of the District to store its official records.

Public Officials Insurance
The District carries Public Officials Liability in the amount of $1,000,000.

Legal Advertising
This is required to conduct the official business of the District in accordance with the Sunshine
Law and other advertisement requirements as indicated by the Florida Statutes.

Bank Fees
The District operates a checking account for expenditures and receipts.

Dues, Licenses & Fees
The District is required to file with the County and State each year.

FISCAL YEAR 2017
AMENDED ANNUAL
OPERATING BUDGET ;
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CORKSCREW FARMS

COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT DISTRICT
GENERAL FUND 001

Miscellaneous Fees
To provide for unbudgeted administrative expenses.

Investment Reporting Fees
This is to provide an investment report to the District on a quarterly basis.

Office Supplies
Cost of daily supplies required by the District to facilitate operations.

Technology Services

This is to upgrade and keep current the operating components to comply with new governmental
accounting standards along with basic website maintenance.

Website Administration

This is for maintenance and administration of the Districts official website.

Capital OQutlay

This is to purchase new equipment as required.

Legal Counsel
District Counsel
Requirements for legal services are estimated at an annual expenditures on an as needed and

also cover such items as attendance at scheduled meetings of the Board of Supervisor's, Contract
preparation and review, etc.

Other Physical Environment
Property & Casualty Insurance

The District carries $1,000,000 in general liability and also has sovereign immunity.

FISCAL YEAR 2017
AMENDED ANNUAL
OPERATING BUDGET o
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CORKSCREW FARMS

COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT DISTRICT
SERIES 2016 BONDS

CDD Debt Service Assessments $ 468,231
Capitalized Interest $ 122,260
TOTAL REVENUES $ 590,492
Series 2016 May Bond Interest Payment $ 468,231
Series 2016 November Bond Principal Payment $ -

Series 2016 November Bond Interest Payment $ 122,260
TOTAL EXPENDITURES $ 590,492
EXCESS OF REVENUES OVER EXPENDITURES $ -

Bonds Outstanding - Period Ending 11/1/2016 $ 20,000,000
Principal Payment Applied Toward Series 2016 Bonds $ -

Bonds Outstanding - Period Ending 11/1/2017 $ 20,000,000

DEBT SERVICE FUND *



CORKSCREW FARMS

COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT DISTRICT

SCHEDULE OF ANNUAL ASSESSMENTS

FISCAL YEAR 2017

FY 2017 Total

EA 1 .
e Unit Collection Fees ¥

Lot Size Unit Count

PHASE 1 -- SERIES 2016 BONDS

Single Family 52'
Single Family 62'
Single Family 75'

Single Family 52'
Single Family 62'

Single Family 75'

Notations:

$1,000.00

$68.32

$1,138.67

1.20 230

$1,200.00

$70.35

$81.09

$1,351.43

1.50 132

$1,500.00

$70.35

$100.23

$1,670.58

PHASE 2 -- FUTURE BOND

$1,000.00

SERIES

$68.32

$1,138.67

1.20 240

$1,200.00

$70.35

$81.09

$1,351.43

1.50 114

$1,500.00

$70.35

$100.23

$1,670.58

" Annual assessments for are adjusted 6% for Lee County collection fees and statutory discounts for early payment.

FISCAL YEAR 2017
AMENDED ANNUAL

OPERATING BUDGET
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RESOLUTION NO 2017-02

A RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF THE
CORKSCREW FARMS COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT DISTRICT
RELATING TO THE ACCEPTANCE OF RESPONSIBILITY FOR
OWNERSHIP, OPERATION AND MAINTENANCE OF DISTRICT
INFRASTRUCTURE WITHIN THE BOUNDARIES OF THE PLAT
OF PLACE AT CORKSCREW; PROVIDING AN EFFECTIVE
DATE.

WHEREAS, Corkscrew Farms Community Development District, hereinafter (the
“District”), was established by Ordinance No. 15-16 adopted by the Board of County
Commissioners of Lee County, Florida on December 15, 2016 pursuant to Chapter 190, Florida
Statutes, as amended; and

WHEREAS, Chapter 190, Florida Statutes grants to the District the authority to own,
operate and maintain surface water management systems, roads and other infrastructure; and

WHEREAS, the District has the authority to construct, acquire and/or maintain
improvements within the District, including surface water management systems, roads and other
District infrastructure; and

WHEREAS, Lee County requires affirmation of the District's intention to maintain the tracts
or easements dedicated to the District, and the District's acknowledgment of its duty and
responsibility to operate and maintain the “backbone” (i.e. master) surface water management
system and other District infrastructure and improvements within the boundaries of the plat of
Place at Corkscrew (the "Plat"), a true and correct copy which is attached as Exhibit “A”; and

WHEREAS, this Resolution will be relied upon by Lee County in reviewing the Plat.

NOW, THEREFORE, be it resolved by the Board of Supervisors of Corkscrew Farms
Community Development District that:

1. This Resolution is adopted pursuant to the provisions of Chapter 190, Florida
Statutes.
2. The District hereby acknowledges and affirms that it will accept maintenance

responsibility for all tracts and easements dedicated to the District, with
maintenance responsibility, appearing within the Plat.

3. Provided, however, that the District's responsibility for maintenance and operation
of the surface water management systems and other facilities and improvements
will not commence unless and until the following events: (a) tracts or easement for
the surface water management system and other facilities and improvements, as
applicable, have been dedicated or conveyed to the District and (b) Lee County
has issued Certificate(s) of Compliance (or their equivalent) for the applicable
surface water management system and/or other facilities and improvements.

4. This Resolution shall take effect immediately upon its adoption.



PASSED AND ADOPTED this day of January, 2017.

CORKSCREW FARMS COMMUNITY
DEVELOPMENT DISTRICT
ATTEST:

Brian Lamb, Secretary Joseph Cameratta, Chairman

STATE OF FLORIDA
COUNTY OF LEE

The foregoing instrument was acknowledged before me this day of January, 2017
by Joseph Cameratta, as Chairman of Corkscrew Farms Community Development District. He
is personally known to me.

Notary Public
Printed Name:

STATE OF FLORIDA
COUNTY OF LEE

The foregoing instrument was acknowledged before me this day of January, 2017
by Brian Lamb, as Secretary of the Corkscrew Farms Community Development District. He is
personally known to me.

Notary Public
Printed Name:
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CORKSCREW FARMS
COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT DISTRICT

September 7, 2016 Minutes of Special Meeting

Minutes of Special Meeting
The Special Meeting of the Corkscrew Farms Community Development District was held on Wednesday,
September 7, 2016 at 12:00 p.m. at The Place at Corkscrew, located at 4954 Royal Gulf Circle, Fort Myers,
FL 33966.

1. CALL TO ORDER/ROLL CALL

Brian Lamb called the Special Meeting of the Board of Supervisors of the Corkscrew Farms
Community Development District to order on Wednesday, September 7, 2016 at 12:00 p.m.

Board Members Present and Constituting a Quorum at the onset of the meeting:

Joseph Cameratta Chairman
Anthony Cameratta Vice Chairman
Cheryl Yano Supervisor
Laura Youmans Supervisor

Staff Members Present:

Brian Lamb District Manager, Meritus
Greg Urbancic District Counsel

2. PUBLIC COMMENT ON AGENDA ITEMS

There were no audience members present.

3. BUSINESS ADMINISTRATIVE
A. Consideration of Resolution 2016-34; Amended Delegating Resolution

Mr. Urbancic briefly reviewed the resolution with the Board.

MOTION TO: Approve Resolution 2016-34
MADE BY: Supervisor J. Cameratta
SECONDED BY: Supervisor A. Cameratta
DISCUSSION: None Further

RESULT: 4/0 Called to Vote: motion PASSED

B. Consideration of Resolution 2016-35; Supplemental Assessment

Mr. Urbancic reviewed and explained the resolution with the Board.

MOTION TO: Approve Resolution 2016-35
MADE BY: Supervisor J. Cameratta
SECONDED BY: Supervisor Yano

DISCUSSION: None Further

RESULT: 4/0 Called to Vote: motion PASSED
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CORKSCREW FARMS COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT DISTRICT
Minutes of the Special Meeting

September 7, 2016

Page 2

C. General Matters of the District
4. STAFF REPORTS
A. District Counsel
B. District Manager
C. District Engineer
There were no staff reports. Mr. Lamb reminded the Board of the next meeting.

5. SUPERVISOR REQUESTS AND AUDIENCE COMMENTS

6. ADJOURNMENT

MOTION TO: Adjourn

MADE BY: Supervisor A. Cameratta
SECONDED BY: Supervisor Yano

DISCUSSION: None Further

RESULT: 4/0 Called to Vote: motion PASSED

*Please note the entire meeting is available on disc.
*These minutes were done in a summary format.
*Each person who decides to appeal any decision made by the Board with respect to any matter considered

at the meeting is advised that person may need to ensure that a verbatim record of the proceedings is made,
including the testimony and evidence upon which such appeal is to be based.

Meeting minutes were approved at a meeting by vote of the Board of Supervisors at a publicly noticed
meeting held on

Signature Signature

Printed Name Printed Name

Title: Title:

o Chair O Secretary

o Vice Chair O Assistant Secretary

Recorded by Records Administrator

Signature

Date

Official District Seal 16
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CORKSCREW FARMS
COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT DISTRICT

September 16, 2016 Minutes of Regular Meeting and Public Hearing

Minutes of Regular Meeting and Public Hearing
The Regular Meeting and Public Hearing of the Corkscrew Farms Community Development District was
held on Friday, September 16, 2016 at 11:00 a.m. at The Place at Corkscrew, located at 4954 Royal Gulf
Circle, Fort Myers, FL 33966.

1. CALL TO ORDER/ROLL CALL

Brian Lamb called the Regular Meeting and Public Hearing of the Board of Supervisors of the
Corkscrew Farms Community Development District to order on Friday, September 16, 2016 at
11:00 a.m.

Board Members Present and Constituting a Quorum at the onset of the meeting:

Joseph Cameratta Chairman
Cheryl Yano Supervisor
Laura Youmans Supervisor

Staff Members Present:

Brian Lamb District Manager, Meritus
Carl A. Barraco District Engineer

2. PUBLIC COMMENT ON AGENDA ITEMS

There were no audience members present.

3. PUBLIC HEARING ON PROPOSED FISCAL YEAR 2017 BUDGET
A. Consideration of Resolution 2016-36; Amending Date of Public Hearing FY 2017 Budget

Mr. Lamb reviewed this resolution with the Board.

MOTION TO: Approve Resolution 2016-36.
MADE BY: Supervisor J. Cameratta
SECONDED BY: Supervisor Youmans
DISCUSSION: None Further

RESULT: 3/0 Called to Vote: motion PASSED

B. Open Public Hearing on Proposed Fiscal Year 2017 Budget

MOTION TO: Open Public Hearing on Proposed Fiscal Year 2017 Budget.
MADE BY: Supervisor J. Cameratta

SECONDED BY: Supervisor Yano

DISCUSSION: None Further

RESULT: 3/0 Called to Vote: motion PASSED
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C. Staff Presentations

CORKSCREW FARMS COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT DISTRICT
Minutes of the Regular Meeting and Public Hearing
September 16, 2016

Mr. Lamb reviewed the budget with the Board.

D. Public Comment

There were no public comments.

E. Close Public Hearing on Proposed Fiscal Year 2017 Budget

MOTION TO:
MADE BY:
SECONDED BY:
DISCUSSION:
RESULT:

Close Public Hearing on Proposed Fiscal Year 2017 Budget.

Supervisor J. Cameratta

Supervisor Yano

None Further

3/0 Called to Vote: motion PASSED

F. Consideration of Resolution 2016-37; Adopting Fiscal Year 2017 Budget

MOTION TO:
MADE BY:
SECONDED BY:
DISCUSSION:
RESULT:

Approve Resolution 2016-37.
Supervisor J. Cameratta

Supervisor Yano

None Further

3/0 Called to Vote: motion PASSED

4. BUSINESS ADMINISTRATIVE

A. Consideration of Budget Funding Agreement

Mr. Lamb reviewed the funding agreement with the Board.

MOTION TO:
MADE BY:
SECONDED BY:
DISCUSSION:
RESULT:

Approve Budget Funding Agreement in substantial form.
Supervisor J. Cameratta

Supervisor Youmans

None Further

3/0 Called to VVote: motion PASSED

B. Consideration of Resolution 2016-38; Designation of Treasurer & Asst. Treasurer

Mr. Lamb reviewed this resolution with the Board.

MOTION TO:
MADE BY:
SECONDED BY:
DISCUSSION:
RESULT:

Approve Resolution 2016-38.
Supervisor J. Cameratta

Supervisor Youmans

None Further

3/0 Called to Vote: motion PASSED

Page 2
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CORKSCREW FARMS COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT DISTRICT
Minutes of the Regular Meeting and Public Hearing

September 16, 2016

Page 3

C. Consideration of Resolution 2016-39; Setting Fiscal Year 2017 Meeting Schedule

The Board and Mr. Lamb reviewed the meeting schedule resolution.

MOTION TO:
MADE BY:
SECONDED BY:
DISCUSSION:
RESULT:

Approve Resolution 2016-39.
Supervisor J. Cameratta
Supervisor Youmans

None Further

3/0 Called to VVote: motion PASSED

D. General Matters of the District

5. CONSENT AGENA

A. Consideration of Board of Supervisors Meeting Minutes July 15, 2016
B. Consideration of Board of Supervisors Meeting Minutes August 1, 2016

C. Consideration of Board of Supervisors Meeting Minutes August 19, 2016

The Board reviewed the minutes and had no changes.

MOTION TO:
MADE BY:
SECONDED BY:
DISCUSSION:
RESULT:

Approve Consent Agenda.
Supervisor J. Cameratta

Supervisor Youmans

None Further

3/0 Called to Vote: motion PASSED

6. STAFF REPORTS
A. District Counsel
B. District Manager
C. District Engineer

Mr. Barraco stated that there were three pay requisitions approved and processed.

7. SUPERVISOR REQUESTS AND AUDIENCE COMMENTS

There were no supervisor requests.

8. ADJOURNMENT

MOTION TO:
MADE BY:
SECONDED BY:
DISCUSSION:
RESULT:

Adjourn.

Supervisor J. Cameratta

Supervisor Youmans

None Further

3/0 Called to VVote: motion PASSED
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CORKSCREW FARMS COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT DISTRICT
Minutes of the Regular Meeting and Public Hearing

September 16, 2016

Page 4

*Please note the entire meeting is available on disc.
*These minutes were done in a summary format.
*Each person who decides to appeal any decision made by the Board with respect to any matter considered

at the meeting is advised that person may need to ensure that a verbatim record of the proceedings is made,
including the testimony and evidence upon which such appeal is to be based.

Meeting minutes were approved at a meeting by vote of the Board of Supervisors at a publicly noticed
meeting held on .

Signature Signature

Printed Name Printed Name

Title: Title:

o Chair O Secretary

o Vice Chair O Assistant Secretary

Recorded by Records Administrator

Signature

Date

Official District Seal

20



January 2017 Meeting

Corkscrew Farms Community Development District
Summary of Operations and Maintenance Invoices

Invoice/Account Vendor
Vendor Number Amount Total Comments/Description

| Monthly Contract | | | |

| Meritus Districts | 7216 | $1,000.00 | | Management Service — August
Meritus Districts 7212 1,000.00 Management Service — April
Meritus Districts 7220 2,812.50 Management Service — December
Meritus Districts 7256 1,000.00 Management Service — February

| Meritus Districts | 7221 | 1,294.76 | | Management Service — January

| Meritus Districts | 7215 | 1,000.00 | | Management Service — July

| Meritus Districts | 7214 | 1,000.00 | | Management Service — June

| Meritus Districts | 7211 | 1,232.03 | | Management Service — March

| Meritus Districts | 7213 | 1,000.00 | | Management Service — May

| Meritus Districts | 7219 ‘ 2,812.50 ‘ | Management Service — November
Meritus Districts 7218 1,000.00 Management Service — October
Meritus Districts 7217 1,000.00 $16,151.79 Management Service — September

| Monthly Contract Sub-Total | | $16,151.79 | |

| Variable Contract | ‘ ‘ |

| Coleman, Yovanovich & Koester, P.A. | 1 ‘ $3,643.00 ‘ | Professional Service thru 02/17/16

| Coleman, Yovanovich & Koester, P.A. | 2 ‘ 2,421.25 ‘ | Professional Service thru 04/08/16

| Coleman, Yovanovich & Koester, P.A. | 3 ‘ 65.00 ‘ | Professional Service thru 06/16/16
Coleman, Yovanovich & Koester, P.A. 4 2,210.00 Professional Service thru 08/05/16
Coleman, Yovanovich & Koester, P.A. 5 861.25 Professional Service thru 09/27/16
Coleman, Yovanovich & Koester, P.A. 6 568.75 Professional Service thru 11/01/16
Coleman, Yovanovich & Koester, P.A. 2 552.50 Professional Service thru 11/01/16
Coleman, Yovanovich & Koester, P.A. 3 812.50 Professional Service thru 12/03/16
Coleman, Yovanovich & Koester, P.A. 7 97.50 $11,231.75 Professional Service thru 12/03/16

| Variable Contract Sub-Total | | $11,231.75 \ |

| Utilities | | | |
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January 2017 Meeting

Corkscrew Farms Community Development District
Summary of Operations and Maintenance Invoices

Invoice/Account Vendor
Vendor Number Amount Total Comments/Description

| Utilities Sub-Total | | $0.00 | |
| Regular Services | ‘ ‘ |
| Shawndel Kaiser | 1 ‘ $300.00 ‘ | Website Development
| Regular Services Sub-Total | | $ 300.00 ‘ |
| Additional Services | | | |

Meritus Districts 7327 $1,591.36 Advertising paid by DMS

Meritus Districts 7510 2,383.27 $3,974.63 Insurance paid by DMS
| Additional Services Sub-Total | | $3,974.63 | |
| TOTAL: | $31,658.17 | |

Approved (with any necessary revisions noted):

Signature Printed Name

Title (check one):
[ ] Chairman [] Vice Chairman [] Assistant Secretary
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Meritus Districts

2005 Pan Am Circle
Suite 120
Tampa, FL 33607

Voice: 813-397-5121
Fax: 813-873-7070

Solutions for Better Communities.

INVOICE

Invoice Number: 7216
Invoice Date: Aug 1, 2016
Page: 1

Bill To:

Ship to:

Corkscrew Farms CDD
| 2005 Pan Am Circle

; Suite 120

| Tampa, FL 33607

| Customer ID Customer PO Payment Terms
Corkscrew Farms CDD Net Due
% Sales Rep ID Shipping Method Ship Date Due Date
@ ) Airborme B 8/1/16
Quantity item e Description < Unit Price Amount
i DMS District Management Services - August 1,000.00
|
|
i
|
i
|
| & |
‘ ‘
i
i
| |
|
‘ ) i O
i |
|
|
| :
| | - e |
ljSubtotaI - 1,000.00|
| Sales Tax E
" Total Invoice Amount 1,000.00
—— —— — !
Check/Credit Memo No: Payment/Credit Applied i
TOTAL ; L 1,000.00
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Meritus Districts
5680 W. Cypress St.

INVOICE

Suite A v Invoice Number: 7212
Tampa, FL 33607 0 Invoice Date: ~ Apr 1, 2016
Merttus Page 1
Voice: 813-873-7300 Districts
Fax: 813-873-7070 Solutions for Better Communities.
| Bill To: _  Ship to:
Corkscrew Farms CDD
2005 Pan Am Circle
Suite 120
Tampa, FL 33607
- CustomeriD ~ Customer PO ~ PaymentTerms
Corkscrew Farms CDD B Net Due
~ SalesRep ID : ~ Shipping Method Ship Date  Due Date
Airbome 4/1/16
 Quantity | = ltem e ‘Descoption: | © UnitPrice” '] Amount " |
DMS District Management Services - April 1,000.00
4\\'
\
. Subtotal 1,000.00
Sales Tax -
Total Invoice Amount 1 ,_OO0.0E
Check/Credit Memo No: Payment/Credit Applied
 TOTAL 1,000.00
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Meritus Districts
2005 Pan Am Circle

INVOICE

Suite 120 ¥ Invoice Number: 7220
Tampa, FL 33607 e Invoice Date: Dec 1, 2016
Merittus e
Voice: 813-397-5121 Districts
Fax: 813-873-7070 Solutions for Better Communities.
EBldo R Sh s |r_§h_i'bmt_6_:m__“ = o oo ;
| Corkscrew Farms CDD ' ;
| 2005 Pan Am Circle ! |
| Suite 120 5
| Tampa, FL 33607 [
| 1
o n D | ] ]
' CustomeriD o Customer PO ! Payment Terms B
_ CorkscrewFarmsCDD | . . Netbee |
= SalesRepD | Shipping Method | shipDate [ Duebats |
L | Awbome 00} s
| Quantity | Item Description ° | UnitPrice - | Amount :
1 |DMS District Management Services - December | | 2,812.50 i
‘ \ | | : [
| | |
f | | |
i | |
| | | N\
| | @ | |
| i |
| | J M |
! ! | 0\4 i \
f ' \
| | | |
| |
i | | f
. | ! | |
| | ? | | |
! : i i !
. : ; i
| | | | |
7 - Sutotal 281250
Sales Tax ] |
Total Invoice Amount | 2,812.50 |
Check/Credit Memo No:  PaymentiGredt sppied . .
TOTAL 5 : 2,81250
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Meritus Districts
2005 Pan Am Circle

INVOICE

Suite 120 Invoice Number: 7256
Tampa, FL 33607 ° Invoice Date: Feb 1,2016
Meri1tus e 1
Voice: 813-397-5121 Districts
Fax: 813-873-7070 Solutions for Better Communities.
| Bill To: Ship to: EE
Corkscrew Farms CDD
2005 Pan Am Circle
Suite 120 [
Tampa, FL 33607 [
| CustomerID Customer PO | Payment Terms
~ Corkscrew Farms CDD | Net Due
SalesRep ID Shipping Method E Ship Date Due Date ;
| Airborne O
Quantity Item Description : Unit Price Amount
DMS District Management Services - February 1,000.00
? |
E i
| [ [ |
\ f |
!
| |
\
|
i
|
|
|
|
i [
| | ;
‘ 1 %
‘ !
| | r
| :
| E | B i ]
| Subtotal 7 ~1,000.00
Sales Tax
Total Invoice f\mo unt 1,000.00
Check/Credit Memo No: Payment/Credit Applied
TOTAL 1,000.00
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Meritus Districts

2005 Pan Am Circle
Suite 120

INVOICE

Invoice Number: 7221

Tampa, FL 33607 Invoice Date: Jan1, 2016
Page: 1
Voice: 813-397-5121 Districts
Fax: 813-873-7070 Solutions for Better Communities.
| Bill To: | Ship to: 3
‘ Corkscrew Farms CDD
| 2005 Pan Am Circle
- Suite 120
i Tampa, FL 33607
| |
= ~ Customer ID Customer PO Tt PaymentTerms |
Corkscrew Farms CDD i ~ Net Due |
SalesRep ID Shipping Method Ship Date : Due Date W
 Airbome 1/1/16 |
[ Quantity Iltem Description Unit Price Amount |
‘ |DMS District Management Services - January 1,000.00 |
| Reimb 12/28/15 ad: Notice of Special , 294.76
i l Organizational Meeting
| |
|
r f
| |
I | i
| ‘e |
| | l
; x
|
\
1
i
|
| |
n _  Subtotal 7 ) 1,204.76
Sales Tax
Total Invoice Amount 1,294.76
Check/Credit Memo No: Payment/Credit Applied o 1
TOTAL 1,204.76

27



Meritus Districts

2005 Pan Am Circle
Suite 120
Tampa, FL 33607

INVOICE

Invoice Number: 7215
Invoice Date: Jul1, 2016

Meritus Sl

Voice: 813-397-5121 Districts
Fax: 813-873-7070 Solutions for Better Communities.
é Bill To: - Ship to:

| Corkscrew Farms CDD
2005 Pan Am Circle
Suite 120

Tampa, FL 33607

- CustomeriD | - Customer PO al L ~ Payment Terms
Corkscrew Farms CDD Net Due
Sales Rep ID ' ~ Shipping Method | shipDate Due Date
Airborne o mmne
~ Quantity L lem P Description | UnitPrice Amount |
DMS District Management Services - July 1,000.00

! ; e ——
| |
i
Subtotal B - 1,000.00
Sales Tax
Total Invoice Amount - 1,000.00
Check/Credit Memo No: Payment/Credit Applied ) ;
TOTAL _ : 1,000.00
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Meritus Districts INVO!CE
2005 Pan Am Circle o lle

Suite 120 Invoice Number: 7214
Tampa, FL 33607 Invoice Date: Jun1, 2016

Meritus S

Voice: 813-397-5121 Districts
Fax: 813-873-7070 Solutions for Better Communities.
' Bill To: = ; ‘Ship to:
| Corkscrew Farms CDD ‘ 5
| |
i
' i
|
~ Customer ID Customer PO e Payment Terms
- Corkscrew Farms CDD _ ~ Net Due
Sales Rep ID Shipping Method . Ship Date Due Date |
B | Airborne | i 6/1/16
| Quantity Item Description | Unit Price Amount
| DMS District Management Services - June [ 1,000.00
| |
[ | ‘
i |
| |
|
|
| | | 1
| | |
: ‘ \
| |
| |
| |
!
Subtotal ' " © 1,000.00
Sales Tax B
Total Invoice Amount [ 1,000.00
Check/Credit Memo No: Payment/Credit Applied | .
TOTAL S b0 i 1,00000)
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Meritus Districts

5380 -/ Cyiress St.

INVOICE

Suite A Invoice Number: 7211
Tampa, FL 33607 Invoice Date:  Mar 1, 2016
Page: 1
Voice: 813-873-7300 Districts
Fax: 813-873-7070 Solutions for Better Communities.
RIS ,_,,,,,, - ....‘.‘____r__________._ J i_ Ship to: e
. Corkscrew Farms CDD ‘ ‘ ‘
2005 Pan Am Circle ! |
| Suite 120 | |
| Tampa, FL. 33607 | i |
loomsnene s, S ] L _J
'l  CustomeriD _Ew—_—"_"  Customer PO o : ﬁj Payment Terms
= } ~ Corkscrew Farms CDD N, B \ - Net Due N
. SalesRepID ~ Shipping Method 3 _ Ship Date J Due Date |
| Airbome | . e
!r__  Quantity Item ¢ Description | UnitPrice '] = Amount = |
. |DMS | District Management Services - March ‘ | 1,000.00 |
| |Reimb i 1/28/16 ad: Notice of Reguiar Board Meeting | [ 232.03 |
| ! | | i
| | | | | |
| | ! | | |
| | | | |
| | | ‘ | | |
: ’ | \ | |
| | | M | | |
| | | | |
| % |
| | | | |
| | | | |
| ‘ i | }
1 | | | |
] | i |
| | 1
! 1 ! 1
| | | !
| | |
. : ! i
| | I
| ! :
| Subtotal | 1,232.03 |
| Sales Tax - N |
Total Invoice Amount - 1 1,232.03 |
Check/Credit Memo No: - Payment/Credit Applied ) - I -
TOTAL . e gl AR e R e S
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The News-Press
media group

news=press.com A GANNETT COMPANY

Please contact us with changes or cancellations as soon as possible, otherwise no further action needed.

TOLL-FREE Local # Email
888-516-9220 239-335-0258 FNPLegals@gannett.com
Customer: CORKSCREW FARMS CDD AdNo: 0001006847
Address: 5680 W CYPRESS ST Net Amt: $232.03
TAMPA FL 33607
USA
Run Times: 1 No. of Affidavits: 1

Run Dates: 01/28/16

Text of Ad:

NOTICE OF REGULAR BOARD
MEETING SCHEDULE
FISCAL YEAR 2016
CORKSCREW FARMS COMMUNITY
DEVELOPMENT DISTRICT

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the
Board of Supervisors of the Corkscrew
Farms  Communit Development
District has scheduled their Regular
Board Meetings for Fiscal Year 2016 to
be held at The Place at Corkscrew, lo-
cated at 4954 Royal Gulf Circle, Fort
Myers, FL 33966 on the following
dates and times:

February 19,2016 11:00 a.m.
March 18, 2016 11:00 a.m.
April 15, 2016 11:00 a.m.
May 20, 2016 11:00 a.m.
June 17, 2016 11:00 a.m.
July 15, 2016 11:00 a.m.
August 19, 2016 11:00 a.m.

September 16, 2016 11:00 a.m.

There may be occasions when one or
more Supervisors will participate by
telephone, At the above location
there will be present a speaker tele-
phone so that interested persons can
attend the meeting at the above loca-
tion and be fully informed of the dis-
cussions taking place either in person
or by telephone communication.

Pursuant to provisions of the Ameri-
cans with Disabilities Act, any person
requiring special accommodations to
participate in these meetings is asked
to advise the District Office at (813)
397-5120, at least 48 hours before the
meetings. If you are hearing or speech
imFaired, please contact the Florida
Relay Service at 1 (800) 955-8770, who
can aid you in contacting the District
Office.

If any person decides to appeal any
decision made by the Board with re-
spect to any matter considered at
these meetings, such person will need
a record of the proceedings and such
Eerson may need to ensure that a ver-
atim record of the proceedings is
made, at his or her own expense, and
which record includes the testimony
and evidence on which the appeal is
based.

Brian Lamb

District Manager
AD#1006847 January 28, 2016
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- Meritus Districts

2005 Pan Am Circle
Suite 120

INVOICE

Invoice Number: 7213

Tampa, FL 33607 0 Invoice Date: May 1, 2016
Meri1tus e
Voice: 813-397-5121 Districts
Fax: 813-873-7070 Solutions for Better Communities.
' Bill To: ; e
| Corkscrew Farms CDD : |
E i
\ _ ___‘ ! S ‘
j Customer ID Customer PO Payment Terms
—| Corkscrew Farms CDD Net Due ‘
: Sales Rep ID Shipping Method Ship Date Due Date |
l B i Airborne i 7 5/1/16 }
| Quantity | Description | Unit Price ~ Amount
1 'DMS | District Management Services - May | 1,000.00
\ ' i
| ‘
i |
i
|
i
i | |
| | | | |
|
: !
| |
| |
: 1 ‘
i | 1
§ | \ !
| ; ‘ 4
i 1
‘ | 1 |
| | | |
1 ;
‘ ‘\ ‘,
| ‘ |
Subtotal ' 11,000.00
Sales Tax
Total Invoice Amount 1,000.00
Check/Credit Memo No: ~Payment/Credit Applied
TOTAL 1,000.00
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Meritus Districts

2005 Pan Am Circle
Suite 120
Tampa, FL 33607

Meritus

INVOICE

Invoice Number: 7219
Invoice Date: Nov 1, 2016

Page: 1
Voice: 813-397-5121 Districts
Fax: 813-873-7070 Solutions for Better Communities.
sy i i P |
. Bill To: | [ Ship to: o

Corkscrew Farms CDD ’

2005 Pan Am Circle g 5 |
| Suite 120 . | _
| Tampa, FL 33607 i ’ I

~ Customer ID Customer PO Payment Terms
L ~ Corkscrew Farms CDD N Net Due
‘; Sales Rep ID Shipping Method Ship Date Due Date |
| ) L Airbome 5 | 1te
| Quantity | Item Sl Description ~ Unit Price ~ Amount !
| i DMS District Management Services - November | 2,812.50 |
| | | |
| ! 3
| |
| |
|
| a ~
| | | D 1
| |
| | | |
| | 3 | |
| 1 \/\ | !
| | | |
1 |
| T i '
\ l | ‘
! | | | [
i [ | i |
| | |
| i | I
! é ! |
| | |
| |
I !
L | ] | o
| Subtotal | 2,812.50 |
}Ealesr Tax 77777 - B 377 - |
| Total Invoice Amount 2,812.5 J
Check/Credit Memo No:  Payment/Credit Applied - |
| TOTAL 2,812.50
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Meritus Districts

‘2005 Pan Am Circle
Suite 120
Tampa, FL 33607

INVOICE

Invoice Number: 7218
Invoice Date: Oct 1, 2016

Meritus ;

Voice: 813-397-5121 DiStI'iCtS

Fax: 813-873-7070 Solutions for Better Communities.

J Bill To: = - ..__.“.,.,.,‘_. ”m_n__i S té

I ‘ -

l Corkscrew Farms CDD i
| 2005 Pan Am Circle ‘

I |
| Suite 120 ; I |
| Tampa, FL 33607 ; | |
T ‘ | |
\ | | . -
Customer ID : - Customer PO ! _ Payment Terms |

Corkscrew Farms CDD Net Due !
Sales Rep ID Shipping Method Ship Date ' Due Date J
, I Airborne B j - 10/1/18 I
~ Quantity ' Item } Description . UnitPrice Amount |
 DMS | District Management Services - October | 1,000.00 i
i |
| E i
[ | | I
r | i '
| ‘ | i
| | | |
| | \ | |
| &5 \\\\ ! | |
[ | [ |
| | | |
1 1 ; i
\ | | |
i 1 !
! | | i i
5 i | ! |
| | | |
i i‘ i '
| | | | |
| | |
| | |
\ [
| .
S B I | |
Subtotal | 1,000.00
| Sales Tax T
Total Invoice Amount 1,000.00 ;
Check/Credit Memo No: Payment/Credit Applied -
TOTAL e 1,000.00 |
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Meritus Districts

2005 Pan Am Circle
Suite 120
Tampa, FL 33607

INVOICE

Invoice Number: 7217
Invoice Date: Sep 1,2016

Page: 1
Voice: 813-397-5121
Fax: 813-873-7070 Solutions for Better Communities.
| Bill To: | | Ship to
Corkscrew Farms CDD i |
2005 Pan Am Circle l i
| Suite 120 '
| Tampa, FL 33607 ‘
Customer ID o ~ Customer PO Payment Terms
Corkscrew Farms CDD __Net Due
Sales Rep ID Shipping Method ; Ship Date - Due Date
| | Arbome { 9/1/16
~ Quantity Item Description UnitPrice |  Amount
;: DMS A0 \ District Management Services - September 1,000.00
i
!
1
1
| [
| |
| |
| |
[ |
j I
i
i
|
| |
!
i
S—
|
| | "L*"“‘ |
Subtotal ) - 1,000.00 |
| Sales Tax - o ’
| Total Invoice Amount 1,000.00
Check/Credit Memo No: Payment/Credit Applied |
TOTAL 1,000.00
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Coleman, Yovanovich & Koester, P.A.
Northern Trust Bank Building
4001 Tamiami Trail North, Suite 300
Naples, Florida 34103-3556
Telephone: (239) 435-3535
Fax: (239) 435-1218

Page: 1
Corkscrew Farms CDD February 17, 2016
c/o Meritus Corp. File No: 6677-001M
Brian Lamb, District Manager Statement No: 1
5680 W. Cypress Street, Suite A
Tampa FL 33607
Attn: Teresa Farlow
Gen Rep
SENT VIA EMAIL TO: teresa.farlow@merituscorp.com
Fees
09/09/2015
GLU Telephone conference with Joe Cameratta and Dominic Cameratta on CDD
formation matters 97.50
10/01/2015
GLU Telephone conference with Joe Camaratta on CDD matters and meeting; Review
multiple email correspondence regarding the same 81.25
10/02/2015
GLU Preparation for meeting on CDD matters; Attendance at meeting on formation and
financing; Follow-up email to Dominic Camaratta 812.50
12/14/2015
GLU Research issues regarding bidding and assignment of construction contract;
Telephone conference with Brian Lamb 487.50
12/17/2015
GLU Exchange multiple email correspondence with Dominic Cameratta 81.25
12/20/2015
GLU Review and respond to email correspondence from Brian Lamb on validation
process 65.00
12/30/2015
GLU Review email correspondence from manager on agenda; work on compilation of
agenda items 162.50
01/04/2016
GLU Review and preparation of documents for initial board meeting 162.50
01/05/2016
GLU Draft developer funding agreement 162.50
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Corkscrew Farms CDD

Gen Rep

01/06/2016
GLU

01/07/2016
GLU

01/08/2016
GLU

01/10/2016
GLU

01/15/2016
GLU

01/08/2016

Commence review of Board agenda materials for initial meeting

Review agenda and prepare for Board meeting; Attendance at Board meeting

Follow-up on meeting matters relating to initial meeting documents; Coordinate
recording of notice of establishment; Draft email correspondence circulating
notice of establishment.

follow up on meeting matters; Draft email correspondence to Brian Lamb with
form waiver

Review and comment on proposed landowner election notice
Professional Fees through 02/17/2016

Advances

Client Advance to Clerk of Court to record Notice of Establishment.
Total Advances

Total Current Work

Balance Due

Page: 2

February 17, 2016

File No:
Statement No:

37

6677-001M
1

243.75

975.00

81.25

65.00

130.00
3,607.50

35.50

35.50

3,643.00

$3,643.00



Corkscrew Farms CDD
c/o Meritus Corp.

Brian Lamb, District Manager
5680 W. Cypress Street, Suite A

Tampa FL 33607

Attn: Teresa Farlow

Gen Rep

02/11/2016
GLU

02/12/2016
GLU

02/18/2016
GLU

02/19/2016
GLU

03/14/2016
GLU

03/15/2016
GLU

03/16/2016
GLU

03/18/2016
GLU

Coleman, Yovanovich & Koester, P.,
Northern Trust Bank Building
4001 Tamiami Trail North, Suite 300
Naples, Florida 34103-3556
Telephone: (239) 435-3535
Fax: (239) 435-1218

File No:
Statement No:

SENT VIA EMAIL TO: teresa.farlow@merituscorp.com

Previous Balance

- e, e

Fees

Exchange email correspondence with Teresa Farlow on agenda items; review

files on same.

Review email correspondence from Teresa Farlow on resolution for meeting;
Draft revisions to resolution; Draft email correspondence to Teresa Farlow.

Review agenda and prepare for Board of Supervisors meeting

Attendance at Board of Supervisors meeting

Review email correspondence from Teresa Farlow regarding agenda;

Commence review

Review and comment on draft agenda meeting packet

Draft email correspondence to Teresa Farlow on meeting matters; Exchange
email correspondence with Teresa Farolow; Review and respond to email
correspondence from Brian Lamb on meeting

Review agenda and prepare for Board of Supervisors meeting; Attendance at
Board of Supervisors meeting

Professional Fees through 04/08/2016

Page: 1
April 08, 2016
6677-001M

$3,643.00

65.00

162.50
162.50

812.50

65.00

243.75

97.50

812.50
2,421.25
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Corkscrew Farms CDD

Gen Rep

Total Current Work

Balance Due

Page: 2

April 08, 2016

File No: 6677-001M
Statement No: 2
2,421.25

$6,064.25
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Colernan, Yovanovich & Koester, P.
Northern Trust Bank Building
4001 Tamiami Trail North, Suite 300
Naples, Florida 34103-3556
Telephone: (239) 435-3535
Fax: (239) 435-1218

Page: 1
Corkscrew Farms CDD June 16, 2016
c/o Meritus Corp. File No: 6677-001M
Brian Lamb, District Manager Statement No: 3
5680 W. Cypress Street, Suite A
Tampa FL 33607
Attn: Teresa Farlow
Gen Rep
SENT VIA EMAIL TO: teresa.farlow@merituscorp.com
Previous Balance $6,064.25
Fees
04/04/2016
GLU Exchange email correspondence with Teresa Farlow on meeting matters 32.50
05/24/2016
GLU Review and respond to email correspondence from Dominic Cameratta (no
charge)
06/27/2016
GLU Review and respond to email correspondence from Teresa Farlow on agenda
materials 32,50
Professional Fees through 06/16/2016 65.00
i,
Total Current Work \// 6@
Balance Due $é129.25
_;"\. > 7’)
= - j 5‘, I «»{ﬂ L
2 /,7 J g 2>
7%
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Coleman, Yovanovich & Koester, P.A
Northern Trust Bank Building
4001 Tamiami Trail North, Suite 300
Naples, Florida 34103-3556
Telephone: (239) 435-3535
Fax: (239) 435-1218

Corkscrew Farms CDD

c/o Meritus Corp.
Brian Lamb, District Manager

5680 W. Cypress Street, Suite A
Tampa FL 33607

Attn: Teresa Farlow

Gen Rep

06/03/2016
GLU

07/07/2016
GLU

07/08/2016
GLU

07/11/2016
GLU

07/13/2016
GLU

07/15/2016
GLU

07/20/2016
GLU

07/21/2016
GLU

SENT VIA EMAIL TO: teresa.farlow@merituscorp.com

Previous Balance —.

Fees

Review agenda for Board of Supervisors meeting; Attendance at Board of
Supervisors meeting

Exchange email correspondence with Dominic Cameratta on requisition
documentation;

Conference call regarding upcoming requisition for meeting.

Exchange email correspondence with Dominic Cameratta, Steve Sanford and
Carl Baracco

Review email correspondence and documents from Carl Barraco; Conference call
regarding requisition matters

Review agenda; Participation in Board of Supervisors meeting

Telephone conference with Ray Blacksmith and Dominic Cameratta regarding
offsite improvement conveyance; Telephone conference with Brian Lamb:
Telephone conference with Carl Baracco; Telephone conference with Charles
Mann; Coordinate on special meeting and process for requisitions

Telephone conference with Carl Baracco on requisition 1

File No:
Statement No:

Page: 1

August 05, 2016

6677-001M
4

$6,129.25

487.50

81.25

243.75

65.00

162.50

162.50

227.50

32.50

4



Corkscrew Farms CDD

Gen Rep

07/22/2016
GLU

07/25/2016

GLU

07/26/2016
GLU

07/27/2016
GLU

File No:
Statement No:

Exchange multiple email correspondence with Manager et al. regarding agenda
for special meeting to approve requisitions

Draft conveyance documents for requisitions 1 and 2; Exchange multiple email
correspondence with Charles Mann; Review and respond to email
correspondence from Dominic Cameratta and Carl Barraco; Initial review of
delivery from Carl Barraco

Exchange multiple email correspondence with Teresa Farlow on requisitions and
agenda; Review and respond to email correspondence from Carl Baracco;
Review forms for requisition 1 and 2; Update conveyance forms; Exchange email
correspondence with Teresa Farlow; Draft email correspondence circulating
forms.

Review and respond to email correspondence from Dominic Cameratta regarding
requisition forms; Update BOS; Draft email correspondence to Charles Mann on
same, Review and respond to email correspondence from Carl Barraco

Professional Fees through 08/05/2016

Total Current Work

Balance Due

Page: 2

August 05, 2016
6677-001M

42

4

65.00

325.00

227.50

130.00
2,210.00

2,210.00

$8,339.25




Coleman, Yovanovich & Koester, P.A.
Northern Trust Bank Building
4001 Tamiami Trail North, Suite 300
Naples, Florida 34103-3556
Telephone: (239) 435-3535
Fax: (239) 435-1218

Corkscrew Farms CDD

c/o Meritus Corp.

Brian Lamb, District Manager
5680 W. Cypress Street, Suite A
Tampa FL 33607

Attn: Teresa Farlow

Gen Rep

SENT VIA EMAIL TO: teresa.farlow@merituscorp.com

Previous Balance

Fees
08/01/2016
GLU Review agenda and prepare for Board of Supervisors meeting; Participation in
Board of Supervisors meeting
08/08/2016
GLU Review and respond to email correspondence from Teresa Farlow on
budget/assessment resolutions; Review and comment on form resolutions; Draft
revisions to resolutions
08/12/2016
GLU Telephone conference with Teresa Farlow on agenda
08/19/2016
GLU Review agenda for Board of Supervisors meeting; Draft resolution continuing
budget public hearing; Draft email correspondence to Brian Lamb on same
08/31/2016
GLU Exchange multiple email correspondence with Teresa Farlow regarding agenda;

review same.
Professional Fees through 09/27/2016

Total Current Work

Balance Due

Page: 1

September 27, 2016
File No: 6677-001M

Statement No:
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$8,339.25

243.75

243.75

65.00

243.75

65.00
861.25

861.25

$9,200.50



Coleman, Yovanovich & Koester, P.A.
Northern Trust Bank Building
4001 Tamiami Trail North, Suite 300
Naples, Florida 34103-3556
Telephone: (239) 435-3535
Fax: (239) 435-1218

Page: 1
Corkscrew Farms CDD November 01, 2016
c/o Meritus Corp. File No: 6677-001M
Brian Lamb, District Manager Statement No: 6
5680 W. Cypress Street, Suite A
Tampa FL 33607
Attn: Teresa Farlow
Gen Rep
SENT VIA EMAIL TO: teresa.farlow@merituscorp.com
Previous Balance $9,200.50
Fees
09/17/2016
GLU Review and respond to email correspondence from Teresa Farlow on meeting
agenda; Telephone conference with Teresa Farlow; Draft revisions to continuation
resolution; Review agenda for Board of Supervisors meeting; Call-in for meeting;
Review and respond to email correspondence from Dominic Cameratta on
developer funding agreement 243.75
09/20/2016
GLU Review developer funding agreement and prepare for call with Dominic
Cameratta; Telephone conference with Dominic Cameratta; Draft email
correspondence to Brian Lamb; initial review of correspondence from Dominic
Cameratta regarding budget and funding 325.00
Professional Fees through 11/01/2016 568.75
Total Current Work 568.75
Payments
Total Payments Through 11/01/2016 -6,129.25
Balance Due $3,640.00
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Corkscrew Farms CDD

c/o Meritus Corp.

Brian Lamb, District Manager
5680 W. Cypress Street, Suite A
Tampa FL 33607

Attn: Teresa Farlow

Requisition

Previous Balance

Fees
09/08/2016
GLU Telephone conference with Dominic Cameratta on requisition matters; Review
and respond to email correspondence from Dominic Cameratta
09/09/2016
GLU Initial review of requisition 3 from Carl Barracco; Draft email correspondence
regarding requisition 3
09/12/2016
GLU Review and respond to email correspondence from Charles Mann regarding
requisition 3; Review email correspondence from Carl Barraco; Conference call
regarding requisition process
09/17/2016
GLU Review email correspondence from Carl Barraco with revised requisition 3; Draft

Requisition 3 documents; Draft email correspondence to group circulating draft

Requisition 3 documents.

Coleman, Yovanovich & Koester, P.A.

Northern Trust Bank Building
4001 Tamiami Trail North, Suite 300
Naples, Florida 34103-3556
Telephone: (239) 435-3535
Fax: (239) 435-1218

Professional Fees through 11/01/2016

Total Current Work

Balance Due

Page: 1

November 01, 2016

File No:
Statement No:

WA

6677-004M
2

$487.50

97.50

97.50

162.50

195.00
552.50

552.50

$1,040.00
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Coleman, Yovanovich & Koester, P.A.
Northern Trust Bank Building
4001 Tamiami Trail North, Suite 300
Naples, Florida 34103-3556
Telephone: (239) 435-3535
Fax: (239) 435-1218

Page: 1
Corkscrew Farms CDD December 03, 2016
c/o Meritus Corp. File No: 6677-004M
Brian Lamb, District Manager Statement No: 3
5680 W. Cypress Street, Suite A
Tampa FL 33607
Attn: Teresa Farlow
Requisition
SENT VIA EMAIL TO: teresa.farlow@merituscorp.com
Previous Balance $1,040.00
Fees
11/03/2016
GLU Review multiple email correspondence from Dominic Cameratta on LCU
payments; Telephone conference with Dominic Cameratta regarding LCU
payments 325.00
11/28/2016
GLU Draft connection fee agreement 487.50
Professional Fees through 12/03/2016 812.50
Total Current Work 812.50
Balance Due $1,852.50

N

\J

G’J\
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Coleman, Yovanovich & Koester, P.A.
Northern Trust Bank Building
4001 Tamiami Trail North, Suite 300
Naples, Florida 34103-3556
Telephone: (239) 435-3535
Fax: (239) 435-1218

Page: 1
Corkscrew Farms CDD December 03, 2016
c/o Meritus Corp. File No: 6677-001M
Brian Lamb, District Manager Statement No: 7
5680 W. Cypress Street, Suite A
Tampa FL 33607
Attn: Teresa Farlow
Gen Rep
SENT VIA EMAIL TO: teresa.farlow@merituscorp.com
Previous Balance $3,640.00
Fees
11/28/2016
GLU Telephone conference with developer regarding construction funds and platting 97.50
Professional Fees through 12/03/2016 97.50
Total Current Work 97.50
Balance Due $3,737.50

A
[\ \
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INVOICE

T
eritus

Date: July 11, 2016
INVOICE # 1

Corkscrew Farms CDD\)
O Meritys

2005 Pan Am Cir . Sutie 120
Tampa, FL 33607
813-397-5120

Customer ID 195

Sales person Job Shipping Method Shipping Terms Delivery Date Payment Terms Due Date

Due on receipt

Qty ltem # Description Unit Price Discount Line Total
1 Required website development $300.00 $300.00
https://corkscrewfarmscddcom.wordpress.com/
Total Discount
subtotal i
Sales Tax e \,
Total $300.00

Make all checks payable to Shawndel Kaiser
Thank you for your business!
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Meritus Districts

2005 Pan Am Circle
Suite 120
Tampa, FL 33607

Voice: 813-397-5121
Fax: 813-873-7070

UJ\ Invoice Number: 7327
Invoice Date: Feb 17, 2016

Meritus \ " P j

Districts \

Solutions for Better Communities.

['BiliTo: Ship to: |
Corkscrew Farms CDD | I
2005 Pan Am Circle !

Suite 120 ; a
| Tampa, FL 33607 1 [
| |
[ Customer ID Customer PO L Payment Terms T
| Corkscrew Farms CDD B ~ Net Due
| Sales Rep ID | Shipping Method ~ Ship Date | Due Date
! ) B} i Airborne | 2/17/16 i
| Quantity | Item Description Unit Price | Amount ]
I : The Ledger ad: 2/23 - 3/15 Notice of | 1,591.36 ‘

| |
; Method of Assessment Collection . g
, ‘
\ | ‘ _‘
1 | [
| | |
| |
| | |
| |
! i
‘ i
|
| |
| |
| | |
|

| | |
| | | |

| |
| |

| ! | ‘
| | | |
| | | | |

o 7 _ | Subtotal - 1,591.36

e e ——— — e
Sales Tax 7
Total Invoice Amount 1 591 36|
Weaaihic . N | | S ) o
Check/Credit Memo No: Payment/Credit APP"Ed - | |
| TOTAL e s s ana G e 1 591 36
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“Meritus Districts
2005 Pan Am Circle

INVOICE

Suite 120 S Invoice Number: 7510
Tampa, FL 33607 o Invoice Date:  Jul 27, 2016
Meritus age:
Voice: 813-397-5121 Districts /
Fax: 813-873-7070 Solutions for Better Communities.
_ Bill To: Ship to: }
Corkscrew Farms CDD ‘ '
2005 Pan Am Circle
Suite 120 ;
| Tampa, FL 33607 |
| B |
Customer ID Customer PO i  Payment Terms
Corkscrew Farms CDD 1 Net Due
Sales Rep ID } Shipping Method Ship Date | Due Date
| | Airbome - | 7/27/16
Quantity Item __— Descripton ——_ | UnitPrice Amount |
LPayment of Insurance Office of America 2,383.27 |
| inv#204079 for D&O liability insurance S i
| | |
i | | | | |
' | \ | | |
| | | l !
| ‘ |
| | | | |
| | | | |
| i J | | |
| | 7 | | |
| | 47 A | | |
| | | AN | |
| | | " | |
i : i | i
f | ! i i
| ? , | '
| i ' ; :
| | | % |
| | | |
| | | |
| ! | .
i ! | l |
| | | | |
| |
| | ! | |
| | |
| 1 | ) | . |
' Subtotal 238327
! Sales Tax B ‘ 7 \
| Total Invoice Amount | 2,383.27 |
Check/Credit Memo No: - Payment/Credit Applied ' ‘
| TOTAL : 2,383.27
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Insurance Office of America, Inc. ' i Invoice # 204079 Page 1of1

P.O. Box 162207 Account Number Date
Altamonte Springs, FL 32716-2207 | CORKFAR-01 3/30/2016
Phone:(800) 243-6899 BALANCE DUE ON
Fax:(407) 788-7933 | /3012016
. AMOUNT PAID Amount Due
Email:
$2,383.27
Corkscrew Farms Community Development District
2005 Pan Am Circle
Suite 120
Tampa, FL 33607
Directors & Officers Liabﬁi-ts.r“ - PolicyNumbr;r: BRLOO11181 : Effective:  3/24/2016 o 3!24;‘2017
Item # Trans Eff Date Due DateTrans Description Amount
1754245 3/24/2016 3/30/2016 NEWB New Business - Directors & Officers Liability $2,231.00
1754246 3/24/2016 3/30/2016 CFEE Company/Brokerage Fee (PPE) $152.27
Total Invoice Balance: $2,383.27
51
3/30/2016 Corkscrew Farms Community Development District Page 10of1



CORKSCREW FARMS COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT DISTRICT
SPECIAL ASSESSMENT BONDS, SERIES 2016
(ASSESSMENT AREA ONE PROJECT)

(Acquisition and Construction)

The undersigned, a Responsible Officer of the Corkscrew Farms Community Development
District (the “District”) hereby submits the following requisition for disbursement under and
pursuant to the terms of the Master Trust Indenture between the District and U.S. Bank National
Association, as trustee (the “Trustee”), dated as of August 1, 2016, as supplemented by that certain
First Supplemental Trust Indenture dated as of August 1, 2016 (collectively, the “Indenture”) (all
capitalized terms used herein shall have the meaning ascribed to such term in the Indenture):

(A)  Requisition Number: 4

(B)  Identify Acquisition Agreement, if applicable; Agreement Regarding the
Acquisition of Certain Work Product, Infrastructure and Real Property

(C)  Name of Payee pursuant to Acquisition Agreement: The Place
Corkscrew, LLC.

(D)  Amount Payable: $693,544.26

(E)  Purpose for which paid or incurred (refer also to specific contract if amount is due
and payable pursuant to a contract involving progress payments):

(F)  Fund or Account and subaccount, if any, from which disbursement to be made:

Series 2016 Acquisition and Construction Account of the Acquisition and
Construction Fund.

The undersigned hereby certifies that:
1. obligations in the stated amount set forth above have been incurred by the District,

2, each disbursement set forth above is a proper charge against the Series 2016
Acquisition and Construction Account;

3. each disbursement set forth above was incurred in connection with the Cost of the
Assessment Area One Project; and

4. each disbursement represents a Cost of Assessment Area One Project which has
not previously been paid.

The undersigned hereby further certifies that there has not been filed with or served upon the
District notice of any lien, right to lien, or attachment upon, or claim affecting the right to receive
payment of, any of the moneys payable to the Payee set forth above, which has not been released
or will not be released simultaneously with the payment hereof.
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The undersigned hereby further certifies that such requisition contains no item representing
payment on account of any retained percentage which the District is at the date of such certificate
entitled to retain.

Originals of the invoice(s) from the vendor of the property acquired or the services rendered with
respect to which disbursement is hereby requested are on file with the District.

CORKSCREW FARMS COMMUNITY
DEVELOPMEN% DISTRICE—~

By:

Date: ll/lgl/{(/)

CONSULTING ENGINEER’S APPROVAL
The undersigned Consulting Engineer hereby certifies that this disbursement is for the Cost of the

Assesstnent Area One Project and is consistent with: (i) the Acquisition Agreement; and (ii) the
report of the Consulting Engineer, as such report shall have been amended or modified.

///ﬁ 65%4/\- j2-0b-/(

Cénsulting Eng‘i’neer
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The Place at Corkscrew, LL

Cc

Project 23331 Corkscrew Farms CDD

Invoice number 16758
Date 08/23/2016

Aging Summary

Invoice total 5,152.10

Invoice Number Invoice Date Outstanding Current QOver 30 Over 60 Over 90 QOver 120
16420 04/26/2016 1,075.00 1,075.00
16672 07/25/2016 107.50 107.50
16758 08/23/2016 5,152.10 5,162.10
Total 6,334.60 5,259.60 0.00 0.00 1,075.00 0.00

The Piace at Corkscrew, LLC

Invoice number 16758

invoice date 08/23/2016
Paé@ 20f2
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RBlacksmith

From: Sawtell, E. Tom <ESawtell@leegov.com>
Sent: Monday, September 12, 2016 11:10 AM
To: Dan Hartley

Cc: RBlacksmith; Dickson, Benjamin

Subject: The Place (DOS2016-00013) re; DO Amendment Submittal

Just the standard base fee for an amendment Dan.
Fom

From: Dan Hartley [mailto:dan@jrevansengineering.com]

Sent: Monday, September 12, 2016 9:46 AM

To: Sawtell, E. Tom

Cc: Ray Blacksmith (RBlacksmith@camerattacompanies.com)

Subject: RE: The Place (D0S2016-00013) re: DO Amendment Submittal

10-4, thanks Tom. We appreciate you taking the time to review with us, always very helpful.

Can you please confirm what the appropriate application fee will be for this DOA? | know the standard is $775, but if
specific circumstances for this DOA require additional fee, we’d like to provide that with our first submittal.

Thanks again Tom,

Daniel C. Hartley, P.E,

J.R. Evans Engineering, P.A.
9351 Corkscrew Road, Suite 102
Estero, FL 33928
www.jrevansengineering.com

c (239) 250-9408

From: Sawtell, E. Tom [mailto:ESawtell@leegov.com]

Sent: Monday, September 12, 2016 9:30 AM

To: Dan Hartley; Ray Blacksmith (RBlacksmith@camerattacompanies.com); tcammeratta@camerattacompanies.com:
Elizabeth Fountain; Josh Evans; Brandon Frey '

Cc: Dickson, Benjamin; Rozdolski, Mikki; Loveland, David; Block, Alvin; Ennis, Audra; Larsen, Sarah; Danley Jr, Dirk;
Evans, Marcus; Lee, Samuel; Karuna-Muni, Anura; Martin, Aaron; Rashford, Gary

Subject: RE: The Place (D0S2016-00013) re: DO Amendment Submittal

Good morning Dan,

Thank you for giving us the opportunity to meet with you last Friday. We have discussed the scope
of your proposed revisions to The Place (D0S2016-00013) and as the scheme of development is not
changing or being substantially altered, pursuant to LDC 10-118, the revisions may be submitted as an
amendment to the Development Order — a new DO will not be required. Your amendment submittal
should include documents as required per FAC Rule 61G15-27.001 as well as affidavits of authorization
from the landowner to address successor engineer requirements.
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Invoice No.

Invoice Date:
Client Code:
Client Name;
Matter Code:

Matter Name:

Please return this page with remittance

to
Lewis, Longman & Walker, PA
515 North Flagler Drive, Suite 1500
West Palm Beach, FL 33401

RSL-115041

October 6, 2016

5544

THE PLACE AT CORKSCREW, LLC

001
CORKSCREW FARMS - FEDERAL ENVIRONMENTAL PERMITTING

Total for Services and Expenses m
Previous Balance 3,696.37

Payments Since Last Invoice -1,950.50
Amount Due —$1,;3_1—:l—§;

Amount enclosed:

Please make checks payable to: Lewis, Longman & Walker P.A.

Please contact our Billing Department at (561) 640-0820 if you wish to pay by credit card.
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Client Ref: 5544 - 001
Invoice No. RSL-114560

Total for Services and Expenses
Previous Balance

Payments Since Last Invoice

Amount Due

Open Invoices for this Matter

Date Invoice No. Amount Billed Amount Paid
08/09/16 114335 1,950.50 0.00

Qutstanding Amount Due:

Current and Outstanding Amount Due:

September 7, 2016

Amount Due

1,850.50

1,950.50

Page 2

$1,645.87

3,195.50

-1,245.00

$3,596.37

$3,596.37

93



Please return this page with remittance

to
Lewis, Longman & Walker, PA
515 North Flagler Drive, Suite 1500
West Palm Beach, FL 33401

Invoice No. RSL-114560

Invoice Date: September 7, 2016

Client Code: 5544

Client Name: THE PLACE AT CORKSCREW, LLC

Matter Code: 001
Matter Name: CORKSCREW FARMS - FEDERAL ENVIRONMENTAL PERMITTING

Total for Services and Expenses W
Previous Balance 3,195.50

Payments Since Last Invoice -1,245.00
Amount Due W

Amount enclosed:

Please make checks payable to: Lewis, Longman & Walker P.A.
Please contact our Billing Department at (561) 640-0820 if you wish to pay by credit card.
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-Ecologist 1i - Office
09/19/2016 DO amendment
Senior Ecologist | - Office
09/20/2016 Lee County DO amendment

09/26/2016 Communication with Hartley re: DO amendment site plan; DO
amendment application

09/27/2016 Lee County DO amendment; communications with Hartley re: site plan
and phase map

09/28/2016 Lee County DO amendment; communication with Clark re: planting
plan

Task 8.A General Consultation and Meetings

Administrative Assistant Ii
09/29/2016 Construction commencement letter to COE
Senior Ecologist | - Office
09/07/2016 Meeting at Evans Engineering; researched zoning requirements

09/12/2016 Researched conservation easement; communication with Hartley re:
site plan

09/15/2016 Communications with Hartley re: conservation easement and
indigenous management plan; researched planting requirements and
bid document

09/16/2016 Researched planting requirements and bid document; communication
with Cameratta re: planting bid; communications with Harlley and Frey
re: grading contours and Lee County DO amendment

09/20/2016 Communication with Hartley re: DO amendment; reviewed cross-
sections

Task 99.A Reimbursables

Color (11x17)
09/20/2016
09/27/20186
09/28/2016
09/29/20186

Color (8x11)
09/27/20186
09/29/2016

Billed

Hours Rate Amount
1.00 105.00 105.00
1.75 135,00 236.25
0.75 135.00 101.25
1.25 135.00 168.75
1.00 135.00 135.00
Task subtotal 3,633.75
Billed

Hours Rate Amount
1.75 55.00 96.25
2,25 135.00 303.75
0.50 135.00 67.50
2.25 135.00 303.75
1.25 135.00 168.75
1.50 135.00 202.50
Task subtotal 1,142.50
Billed

Units Rate Amount
2.00 2.65 5.30
5.00 2.65 13.25
3.00 2.65 7.95
5.00 2.65 13.25
1.00 1.35 1.35
1.00 1.35 1.35
Task subtotal 42.45

The Place at Corkscrew, LLC Invoice number 11A

Invoice date 10/10/2016

Page 2 of 2
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Task 5.B Phase | Pre-Construction Listed Species Survey

Billed
Hours Rate Amount
Administrative Assistant 1]
09/26/2016 Listed species survey report 2.75 55.00 151.25
09/29/2016 Listed species survey report 2.00 55.00 110.00
AutoCAD lI/GIS Analyst
09/12/2016 Figures for pre-construction listed species survey 1.50 90.00 135.00
AutoCAD [V/GIS Analyst
09/29/2016 Figures for Phase 1 listed species survey 2.75 110.00 302.50
Ecolodgist 1l - Office
09/01/2016 Phase 1 listed species survey report 3.50 105.00 367.50
09/12/2016 Phase 1 listed species survey report 2.25 105.00 236.25
09/16/2016 Phase 1 listed species survey report 3.50 105.00 367.50
Senior Ecologist [ - Office
09/23/2016 Listed species survey report 1.75 135.00 236.25
Principal Ecologist - Office
09/29/2016 Phase 1 listed species survey report 1.00 250.00 250.00
Task subtotal 2,156.25
Task 99.B Reimbursables
Billed
Units Rate Amount
Aerial Photos (24 x 36)
09/06/2016 1.00 20.00 20.00
09/26/2016 2.00 20.00 40.00
Color (11x17)
09/29/2016 3.00 2.65 7.95
Color (8x11)
09/06/2016 2.00 1.35 2,70
09/29/2016 6.00 1.35 8.10
Task subtotal 78.75
The Place at Corkscrew, LLC Invoice number 2B invoice date 10/10/2016
Page 2 of 2
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Billed
Hours Rate Amount
Senior Ecologist | - Office
08/03/2016 Researched COE Nationwide permit; COE data sheets and UMAM 1.25 135.00 168.75
analysis
08/04/2016 COE data sheets and UMAM analysis 0.75 135.00 101.25 L
08/09/2016 Letter to DeFrance re: Nationwide permit review; COE data sheets; 1.50 135.00 202,50
UMAM analysis
08/11/2016 Communications with DeFrance and Siegrist re: COE permit review 0.75 135.00 101.25 -
status; communication with Blacksmith and Cameratta re: COE wetland
mitigation; letter to DeFrance /
08/17/2016 Reviewed COE Nationwide permit; communications with DeFrance, 1.50 135.00 202.50
Blacksmith, and Duke re: COE Nationwide conditions
Task subtotal 1,413.75
Task 8.A General Consultation and Meetings
Billed
Hours Rate Amount
Administrative Assistant Il -
08/01/2016 Planting plan; upland restoration planting table 1.75 55.00 96.25
AutoCAD IV/GIS Analyst
08/01/2016 Planting plan revisions 0.50 110.00 5500 v
08/02/2016 Added silt fences to prerservation and restoration plan 1,50 110.00 165.00 /
08/03/2016 Wetland lines; silt fence; boundary maps with variations 2.00 110.00 220.00
AutoCAD V/GIS Manager i}
08/02/2016 Silt fence map 0.75 125.00 93.75 ~
Senior Ecologist | - Office
08/01/2016 Reviewed hydrological analysis; meeting with Lee County; 4.50 “135.00 607.50 -
communications with Martin and Clark re: revised planting schedule;
revised indigenous management plan; coordination for pre-construction
meetings s
08/03/2016 Communications with DeFrance re: COE permit review; communication 1.25 135.00 168.75
with Blacksmith and Cameratta re: pre-construction and monitoring
requirements
08/23/2016 Reviewed conservation easement document; communication with 0.50 135.00 67.50 /
Alderman re: PHU ledger -
08/30/2016 Researched COE permit requirements 0.50 135.00 67.50 /
08/31/2016 Communication with Alderman re: USFWS PHU ledger; researched 0.50 135.00 67.50
protected species management plan
Senior Ecologist | - Field
08/02/2016 On-site meeting with SFWMD and Lee County 2,25 135.00 303.75
Task subtotal 1,912.50
Task 99.A Reimbursables
Billed
Units Rate Amount
Aerial Photos (24 x 36)
08/02/2016 2.00 20.00 40.00
Color (11x17)
08/03/2016 1.00 2.65 2.65
Color (8x11)
08/03/2016 8.00 1.35 10.80
08/04/2016 62,00 1.35 83.70
08/08/2016 2.00 1.35 2.70
Task subtotal 139.85
The Place at Corkscrew, LLC Invoice number 10A Invoice date 09/14/2016

Page 2Zxf 2
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Billed
Hours Rate Amount
Ecologist |l - Field
08/30/2016 Phase 1 listed species survey (3 Ecol Il @ 4.0 hrs) 12.00 105.00 1,260.00
08/31/2016 Phase 1 listed species survey (3 Ecol Il @ 8.0 hrs) 24,00 105.00 2,520.00
Senior Ecologist | - Office
08/08/2016 Coordination for listed species survey 1.00 135.00 135,00 /
08/18/2016 Coordination for listed species survey 1.00 135.00 135.00 .
08/22/2016 Listed species location map; communication with Cameratta re: pre- 0.50 135.00 67.50
construction surveys /
08/31/2016 Listed species survey report 1.25 135.00 168.75
Task subtotal 12,592.50
Task 99.B Reimbursables
Billed
Units Rate Amount
Aerial Photos (24 x 36)
08/10/2016 1.00 20.00 20.00
The Place at Corkscrew, LLG Invoice number 1 Invoice date 09/14/2016

Page,l?oaf 2




103



104



105



106



107



108



109



Thanks

Carl A. Barraco, P.E.

President

3arraco and Associates, Inc.

Civil Engineers ~ Land Surveyors ~ Planners
2271 McGregor Boulevard

Fort Myers, FL 33901

Phone: (239) 461-3170

Fax: (239) 461-3169

www.barraco.net

File:23331

From: dcameratta [mailto:dcameratta@camerattacompanies.com]
Sent: Monday, November 21, 2016 3:01 PM

To: Carl A. Barraco <CarlB@barraco.net>

Cc: Amy Fontaine <AmyF@barraco.net>

Subject: RE: Follow Up - Requisition

Great. Thank you.

Dominic Cameratta

Cameratta Companies | Chief Financial Officer
4954 Royal Gulf Circle | Fort Myers, FL 33966
Phone: 239.425.8662 | Cell: 440.773.8902
Email: dcameratta@camerattacompanies.com
Website: www.camerattacompanies.com

From: Carl A. Barraco [mailto:CarlB@barraco.net]

Sent: Monday, November 21, 2016 2:49 PM

To: dcameratta <dcameratta@camerattacompanies.com>
Cc: Amy Fontaine <AmyF@barraco.net>

Subject: RE: Follow Up - Requisition

We are working on it and organizing the documents in the same manner as previous requisitions. | will then go through
each one individually and prepare a summary. | hope to complete it tomorrow or Wednesday.

Carl A. Barraco, P.E.

President

Barraco and Associates, Inc.

Civil Engineers ~ Land Surveyors ~ Planners
2271 McGregor Boulevard

Fort Myers, FL 33901

Phone: (239) 461-3170

Fax: (239) 461-3169

www.barraco.net

File:23331

rrom: dcameratta [mailto:dcameratta@camerattacompanies.com]
Sent: Monday, November 21, 2016 1:22 PM
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To: Carl A. Barraco <CarlB@barraco.net>
Subject: Follow Up - Requisition

Carl,

What is the status of Requisition AA1-004? Thank you.

Dominic Cameratta

Cameratta Companies | Chief Financial Officer
4954 Royal Gulf Circle | Fort Myers, FL 33966
Phone: 239.425.8662 | Cell: 440.773.8902
Email: dcameratta@camerattacompanies.com
Website: www.camerattacompanies.com
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PBISANDHILL

Grow+Enhance:Reslore

Sandhill Environmental Services, LLC

5980 SE County Road 760
Arcadia, FL 34266

9/27/2016

Office: 863-494-9737
Fax: 863-494-1364

The Place At Corkscrew, LLC

4954 Royal Gulf Circle . .
Fort Myers, FL 33966 office@sandhillgrowers.com

www sandhillgrowers.com

Phase 1C
Trees (Table 5 - scattered slash pine & cluster other trees) -
70% 3.9 »
Installed 1 G... |Slash Pine - need greater than 50% 1,748 3.00 5,244,00*
Installed 1 G... |Live Oak 38| 300 116400 %
Installed 1 G... |Laurel Oak 388 3.00 1 64.00‘-;,
installed 1 G... |Dahoon Holly 389 3.00 1,167.00+
Trees (Table 5 - scattered slash pine & cluster other trees) -
30% 4.0 /
Installed 3 G... |Slash Pine - need greater than 50% 750 6.50 4,875.00 '*/
Installed 3 G... {Live Oak 166 6.50 1,079.00 4
Installed 3 G... |Laurel Oak 166 6.50 1,079.00 '-:;
Installed 3 G... |Dahoon Holly 166 6.50 1,079.00 +
Groundcover {4 species - Table 5) 4.1
Installed 2" li... {Muhly Grass 14,627 0.75 10970254
Installed 2" li... |Fakahatchee Grass 14,627 0.75 10,970.25 o=
Installed 2" li... |Cordgrass 14,627 0.75 10,970.25 «+
Instalied 2" li... |Purpie Lovegrass 14,626 0.75 10,969.50 ==
Amount Due Deposit Contract Grow $63,029.65 x 15%=
$9.,454.45
Total $63,029.45
Payments/Credits $0.00
Balance Due $63,029.65

Specializing In

Natural Areas Weed Managements Nuisance/Exotic Species Removal
Lake/Littoral Shelf Plant installation «Wetland & Upland Restoration Planting

Page 2
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PR ISANDHILL

Grow +*Enhance «Reslore

Sandhill Environmental Services, LLC

5980 SE County Road 760
Arcadia, FL 34266

The Place At Corkscrew, LLC
4954 Royal Guif Circle
Fort Myers, FL 33966

9/27/2016

Office: 863-494-9737
Fax: 863-494-1364
office@sandhiligrowers.com
www.sandhillgrowers.com

Specializing In

Balance Due

Natural Areas Weed Managements Nuisance/Exotic Species Removal
Lake/Littoral Shelf Plant instaliation *Wetland & Upland Restoration Planting

Page 2

Phase 1B

Installed 3 G... |Slash Pine 8 650 52004

Lone |

Groundcover (2 species - Table 4) - 50% 3.8

Groundcover (2 species - Table 4) - 50% 3.9
Installed 2" li... |Muhly Grass 2,110 0.75 1,582.50 -+
Installed 2" li... |Sawgrass 2,110 0.75 1,582.50

Upland Restoration (Farm Fields) - SW Corner

Trees (Table 5 - scattered slash pine & cluster other trees) -

70%
Installed 1 G... |Slash Pine 207 3.00 62100
Installed 1 G... |Cypress 207 3.00 621.00 ¥°
installed 1 G... |Dahoon Holly 207 3.00 621.00%
Installed 1 G... |Laurel Oak 207 3.00 621,00 ¥~

Trees (Table 5 - scaltered slash pine & cluster other trees) -

30%
Installed 3 G... |slash Pine 90 6.50 585.00 1
installed 3 G... |Cypress 88 6.50 572.00 7
Installed 3 G... | Dahoon Holly 89 6.50 578.50 ;
Installed 3 G... |Laurel Oak 88 6.50 572.00 9

Groundcover {4 species - Table 5)

Total
Payments/Credits
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4

SANDHILL

Grow+«EnhanceRestore

Sandhill Environmental Services, LLC

5980 SE County Road 760
Arcadia, FL 34266

The Place At Corkscrew, LLC
4954 Royal Gulf Circle
Fort Myers, FL 339266

9/27/2016

Office: 8B63-494-9737
Fax: 863-494-1364
office@sandhillgrowers.com
www.sandhillgrowers.com

Installed 2" Ii...
Installed 2" i...
Installed 2" ...
Installed 2" [i...

Installed 1
Installed 1
Installed 1
Installed 1

Installed 3 G...
Installed 3 G...
Installed 3 G...
Installed 3 G...

Instalied 2" 1i...
Installed 2" ...

OO0

Specializing In

Phase 1B
Gulf Paspalum 4,159 0.75 3,119.25 ‘;
Fakahatchee Grass 4,159 0.75 3,119.25 ‘/
Cordgrass 4,159 0.75 3,119.25 ‘/
Wiregrass 4,158 0.75 3,118.50 ¥
Upland Restoration {Farm Fields)
Trees (Table 5 - scattered slash pine & cluster other trees) -
70%

. |Slash Pine - need greater than 50% 4,475 3.00 13,425.00"/
Live Oak 994 3,00 2,982,00 r:
Dahoon Holly 994 3.00 2,982.00 1
Laurel Oak 993 3.00 2,979.00 1
Trees {Table 5 - scattered slash pine & cluster other trees) -

30%
Slash Pine - need greater than 50% 1918 6.50 12,467.00 "7
Live Oak 426 6.50 2,769.00 '/
Dahoon Holly 426 6.50 2,769.00
Laurel Oak 426 6.50 2,769.00 "
Groundcover (4 species - Table 5) e
Muhly Grass 37,448 0.75 28,086.00 T~
Fakahatchee Grass 37.448 0.75 28,086.00 ]
Total
Payments/Credits

Balance Due

Natural Areas Weed Management s Nuisance/Exotic Species Removal
Lake/Littoral Shelf Plant Installation sWetland & Upland Restoration Planting

Page 3
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PBISANDHILL

Grow «Enhance *Resltore

Sandhill Environmental Services, LLC

5980 SE County Road 760
Arcadia, FL 34266

The Place At Corkscrew, LLC
4954 Royal Gulf Circle
Fort Myers, FL 33966

9/27/2016

1097

Office: 863-494-9737
Fax: 863-494-1364
office@sandhiligrowers.com
www.sandhiligrowers.com

Phase 1B
Installed 2" 1i... |Cordgrass 37,448 0.75 28,086.00 ‘;
Installed 2" 1i... |Purple Lovegrass 37,448 0.75 28,086,001
Amount Due Deposit Contract Grow $176,945.15 x 15%=
$26,541.77
Total $176,945.15
Payments/Credits $0.00
Balance Due $176,945.15

Specializing In

Natural Areas Weed Management s Nuisance /Exolic Species Removal
Lake/Littoral Shelf Plant Installation sWetland & Upland Restoration Planting

Page 4
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PBSANDHILL

Grow +«Enhance s Restore

Sandhill Environmental Services, LLC

5980 SE County Road 760
Arcadia, FL 34266

The Place At Corkscrew, LLC
4954 Royal Guif Circle
Fort Myers, FL 33966

?/29/2016

Office: 863-494-9737
Fax: 863-494-1364

office@sandhillgrowers.com
www.sandhillgrowers.com

Specializing In

Balance Due

Natural Areas Weed Managements Nuisance /Exotic Species Removal
Lake/Littoral Shelf Plant installation sWetland & Upland Resforation Planting

Page 2

Phase 1A
Installed 4" Li... |Little Blue Maidencane 230 1.00 230.00 4
1SFWMD Wetland Restoration Trees {50% cypress + 2 other

species) 1.8 L
Installed 3 G... |Bald Cypress 336 6.50 2,184.00 "/
Installed 3 G... |[Red Maple 168 6.50 1,092.00""/
Installed 3 G... |Slash Pine 168 6.50 1,092.00™
installed 2" li... |Wiregrass 2,799 0,75 2,099.25 ';
Installed 2" [i... |Sawgrass . 2,799 075 2,099.25+

Wetland Flow-Way Restoration {Farms Fields) Trees (planted

in clusters along edge) - 70% 2.0 P
Installed 1 G... |Bald Cypress 171 2,60 444.60"/
Installed 1 G... |Slash Pine 171 2.60 444,60 <

Trees (planted in clusters along edge) - 30% 2.1 s
Installed 3 G... |Bald Cypress 73 6.50 474.50 '/
Installed 3 G... [Slash Pine 73 6.50 474.50

Zone 1

Groundcover {2 species - Table 4) - 50% 2.3

Total
Payments/Credits
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PBISANDHILL

Grow+Enhance +Restore

Sandhill Environmental Services, LLC

5980 SE County Road 760
Arcadia, FL 34266

The Place At Corkscrew, LLC
4954 Royal Gulf Circle
Fort Myers, FL 33966

9/29/2016

Office; 863-494-9737
Fax: 863-494-1364
office@sandhillgrowers.com
www.sandhillgrowers.com

Specializing in

Balance Due

Natural Areas Weed Management« Nuisance/Exotic Species Removal
Lake/Littoral Shelf Plant Installation sWetland & Upland Restoration Planting

Page 3

Phase 1A
1 H ;/

Installed 4" Li... | Sawgrass 19,024 1.00 19,024.007] .
Installed 4" Li... | Bulrush 19,023 1.00 19.023.00 7

lone 2

Groundcover (2 species - Table 4) 2.4

Upland Restoration (Farm Fields) - SW Corner

Trees {Table 5 - scattered slash pine & cluster other frees)

(70% -1 gal) 2.6 >
Installed 1 G... |Slash Pine 919 3.00 2.757.00 1,
Installed 1 G... | Cypress 919 3.00 2,757.00 L
Installed 1 G... | Dahoon Holly 919 3.00 2,757.00 -
Instalied 1 G... {Laurel Oak 919 3.00 2,757.00 L~
Installed 1 G... |Maple 219 3.00 2,757.00

Trees {Table 5 - scattered slash pine & cluster other frees)

(30% - 3 gal) 2.7 P
Installed 3 G... |Slash Pine 493 6.50 3,204.50 "/
Installed 3 G... | Cabbage Paim 492 6,50 3,198.00 1
Installed 3 G... | Dahoon Holly 492 6.50 3,198.00 ~§
Installed 3 G... {Laurel Oak 492 6.50 3,198.00

Groundcover (4 species - Table 5) - 50% 2.8
Installed 2" 1i... | Wiregrass 11,537 0.75 8,652.75 'é

Total
Payments/Credits
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PBISANDHILL

Grow +Enhance +Resiore

Sandhill Environmental Services, LLC

5980 SE County Road 760
Arcadia, FL 34266

The Place At Corkscrew, LLC
4954 Royal Gulf Circle
Fort Myers, FL 33966

9/29/2016

Office: 863-494-9737
Fax: 863-494-1364
office@sandhiligrowers.com
www .sandhillgrowers.com

Specidlizing in

Balance Due

Natural Areas Weed Managements Nuisance/Exotic Species Removal
Lake/Littoral Shelf Plant installation «Wetland & Upland Restoration Planting

Page 4

Phase 1A

Installed 2" li... | Gulf Paspalum 11,537 075 8,652.75"‘¢
Installed 2"1i... |Cordgrass 11,537 0.75 8,652.75"
Installed 2" li... |Fakahatchee Grass 11,536 0.75 8,652,00 1

Groundcover (4 species - Table 5) - 50% 2.9 ps
installed 4" Li... | Wiregrass 11,537 1.00 11,537.00 '/
Installed 4" Li... | Gulf Paspalum 11,537 1.00 11,537.00 7
Installed 4" Li... [ Cordgrass 11,537 1.00 11,537.00 ~//
Installed 4" Li... | Fakahatchee Grass 11,536 1.00 11,536.00

Upland Restoration (Farm Fields) - East Side

Trees (Table 5 - scattered slash pine & cluster other trees) -

70% 3.0
Installed 1 G... | Slash Pine - need greater than 50% 4,100 3.00 12,300.00 *;
Installed 1 G... |Laurel Oak 1.374 3.00 4,122,00 ‘/
Installed 1 G... | Dahoon Holly 1,374 3.00 4,122.00

Trees (Table 5 - scattered slash pine & cluster other trees) -

30% 3.1
Installed 3 G... | Slash Pine - need greater than 50% 1,761 6.50 11,446.50 ~5
Instalted 3 G... |Laurel Oak 587 6.50 3.815.50
Installed 3 G... | Dahoon Holly 587 6.50 3,815.50 v

Groundcover (4 species - Table 5) 3.2

Total
Payments/Credits
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EB/SANDHILL

row+Enhance «+Reslore

Sandhill Environmental Services, LLC

5980 SE County Road 760
Arcadia, FL 34266

The Place At Corkscrew, LLC
4954 Royal Gulf Circle
Fort Myers, FL 33966

9/29/2016

1096

Office: 863-494-9737
Fax: 863-494-1364
office@sandhiligrowers.com
www . sandhiflgrowers,.com

Phase 1A
Installed 2" Ii... |Wiregrass 34,392 0.75 25,794.00 ~§
Installed 2" li... |Muhly Grass 34,392 0.75 25,794.00 "/
Installed 2"li... |Cordgrass 34,392 0.75 25,794.00 1~
Installed 2"li... |Purple Lovegrass 34,392 0.75 25,794.00 7
Amount Due Deposit Contract Grow $302,541.95 x 15%=
$45,381.29
Total $302,541.95
Payments/Credits $0.00
Balance Due $302,541.95

Specializing In

Natural Areas Weed Managementes Nuisance/Exotic Species Removal
Lake/Littoral Shelf Plant Installafion *Wetland & Upland Resforation Planting

Page 5
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Project 15908.00 Pinewoods MPS - The Place at Corkscrew Invoice 0028520
Total Fee 0.00
Total this Task 0.00
Task EN204 Task 2.4 100% Design
Fee
Total Fee 22,924.00
Percent Complete 100.00 Total Earned 22,924.00
Previous Fee Billing 22,924.00
Current Fee Billing 0.00
Total Fee 0.00
Total this Task 0.00
Task EN205 Task 2.5 Permitting
Fee
Total Fee 5,732.00
Percent Complete 100.00 Total Earned 5,732.00
Previous Fee Billing 5,732.00
Current Fee Billing 0.00
Total Fee 0.00
Total this Task 0.00
Task EN206 Task 2.6 Bidding
Billing Limits Current Prior To-Date
Total Billings 0.00 2,485.00 2,485.00
Limnit 2,700.00
Remaining 215.00
Total this Task 0.00
Task EN207 Task 2.7 Construgcti
Professional Personnel S
il (emibior
AP v Hours Rate Amount
Senior Engineer | (P.E.) o M‘.sg G@“ 10.00 160.00 1,600.00
Totals oo Coor® + 1000 1,600.00
Total Labor LA 1,600.00 -
Consultants
Services billed at 1.0
10/6/2016 RKS Consulting Engineers, Inc. 495,00
Total Consultants 1.0 times 495,00 495,00 .-
Billing Limits Current Prior To-Date
Total Billings 2,095.00 21,634.72 23,729.72
Limit 36,338.00
Remaining 12,608.28
Total this Task $2,095.00
Total this Phase $2,095.00
Phase 900 Rebillables
Total this Phase 0.00

Please include the project number and invoice number on your check.

Page 2
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Project 15908.00 Pinewoods MPS - The Place at Corkscrew Invoice 0028520
Total this Invoice $2,095.00
Outstanding Invoices
Number Date Balance
0028404 5/8/2016 11,580.00
Total 11,590.00
Please include the project number and invoice number on your check. Page 3
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15908.00

Project Pinewoods MPS - The Place at Corkscrew Invoice 0028404
Total Fee 0.00
Total this Task 0.00
Task EN204 Task 2.4 100% Design
Fee
Total Fee 22,924.00
Percent Complete 100.00 Total Earned 22,924.00
Previous Fee Billing 22,924.00
Current Fee Billing 0.00
Total Fee 0.00
Total this Task 0.00
Task EN205 Task 2.5 Permitting
Fee
Total Fee 5,732.00
Percent Complete 100.00 Total Earned 5,732.00
Previous Fee Billing 5,732.00
Current Fee Billing 0.00
Total Fee 0.00
Total this Task 0.00
Task EN206 Task 2.6 Bidding
Billing Limits Current Prior To-Date
Total Billings 0.00 2,485.00 2,485.00
Limit 2,700.00
Remaining 215.00
Total this Task 0.00
Task EN207 Task 2.7 Constraetiorr#@min
Professional Personnel w‘s% LT CraTiord
CORSTAVLT o F PLA S Hours Rate Amount
Administrative Assistant Cour‘f"] .50 75.00 37.50
Project Engineer (P.E.) far Let 300  145.00 435.00
Senior Engineer | (P.E.) 13.00 160.00 2,080.00
Designer 10.00 95.00 950.00
Totals 26.50 3,502.50
Total Labor 3,502.50 Ve
Consultants
Services billed at 1.0
8/31/2016 RKS Consulting Engineers, Inc. 8,087.50
Total Consultants 1.0 times 8,087.50 8,087.50 7
Billing Limits Current Prior To-Date
Total Billings 11,590.00 10,044.72 21,634.72
Limit 36,338.00
Remaining 14,703.28
Total this Task $11,590.00 -~
Total this Phase $11,590.00
Please include the project number and invoice number on your check. Page 2
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Project 15908.00 Pinewoods MPS - The Place at Corkscrew Invoice 0028404

Phase 900 Rebillables

Total this Phase 0.00

Total this Invoice $11,590.00

Outstanding Invoices

Number Date Balance
0028260 8/5/2016 2,511.50
Total 2,511.50

Please include the project number and invoice number on your check. Page 3
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Trebilcock Consulting Solutions, PA
- 1205 Piper Boulevard, Suite 202
‘I‘peh"cnc" Naples, FL 34110
(239) 566-9551
planninp-gngineering mking@trebilcock.biz
http://www.trebilcock.biz

INVOICE

BILLTO INVOICE # 16755

Ray Blacksmith DATE 08/31/2016
Corkscrew Lakes, LLC DUE DATE 08/31/2016
4954 Royal Guif Circle TERMS Due on receipt

Fort Myers, FL. 33966

CUDATEL L ACTIMITY. e gy aTE L aoINT

08/31/2016 Corkscrew Road at Stoneybrook Golf Drive 1 1,000.00 1,000.00
(Pinewoods Elementary) Intersection Analysis /
. Corkscrew Road at Stoneybrook Golf Drive
(Pinewoods Elementary) Intersection Analysis: Task
1 - Traffic Counts

Dan Hartley, J.R. Evans Project Manager BALANCE DUE $1 000 00
, n

Puace K Copypenew
e Joimy

3 g 16
% \,000 00

© Gepeanror oF K QR e gopanins T
gL A& K CRBMT To Tee Reguetd
o COST  wiTw Le& Con .

Teerert CouwTt WEME RTRED
BT B oewensy elgwe T
PO PORTIOATE SHALE TRAPT
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Corkscrew Farms
Community Development District

Financial Statements
(Unaudited)

Period Ending
November 30, 2016

Solutions for Better Communities.

Meritus Districts
2005 Pan Am Circle ~ Suite 120 ~ Tampa, FL. 33607-1775
Phone (813) 873-7300 ~ Fax (813) 873-7070
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Corkscrew Farms CDD

Balance Sheet

As of 11/30/2016
(In Whole Numbers)

Debt Service Capital Project General
Fund - Series Funds - Series General Fixed Long-Term
General Fund 2016 2016 Assets Debt Total
Assets
Cash--Operating Account 1,750 0 0 0 0 1,750
Investments - Interest - Series 0 0 0 0 0 0
2016
Investment - Reserve - Series 0 959,305 0 0 0 959,305
2016
Investment - Prepayment - 0 3 0 0 0 3
Series 2016
Investment - Capitalized Interst- 0 74 0 0 0 74
Series 2016
Investment - Acg/Construction 0 0 16,393,714 0 0 16,393,714
Fund - Series 2016
Investment - Cost of Issuance - 0 0 6,601 0 0 6,601
Series 2016
Construction Work in Progress 0 0 0 1,943,340 0 1,943,340
Amount Available-Debt Service 0 0 0 0 1,081,188 1,081,188
Amount To Be Provided-Debt 0 0 0 0 18,518,812 18,518,812
Service
Total Assets 1,750 959,382 16,400,316 1,943,340 19,600,000 38,904,788
Liabilities
Accounts Payable 7,453 0 0 0 0 7,453
Accrued Expenses Payable 0 0 0 0 0 0
Bonds Payable - Series 2016 0 0 0 0 19,600,000 19,600,000
Total Liabilities 7,453 0 0 0 19,600,000 19,607,453
Fund Equity & Other Credits
Fund Balance-All Other Reserves 0 1,080,948 16,389,362 0 0 17,470,310
Fund Balance-Unreserved (1,321) 0 0 0 0 (1,321)
Investment in General Fixed 0 0 0 1,943,340 0 1,943,340
Assets
Other (4,381) (121,566) 10,954 0 0 (114,993)
Total Fund Equity & Other Credits (5,703) 959,382 16,400,316 1,943,340 0 19,297,336
Total Liabilities & Fund Equity 1,750 959,382 16,400,316 1,943,340 19,600,000 38,904,788
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Revenues
Special Assessments - Service Charges
Discounts & Collection Fees
Operation & Maintenance-Off Roll
Total Revenues

Expenditures
Financial & Administrative
District Manager
District Engineer
Trustee Fees
Auditing Services
Postage, Phone, Faxes, Copies
Public Officials Insurance
Bank Fees
Dues, Licenses, & Fees
Legal Counsel
District Counsel
Other Physical Environment
Property & Casualty Insurance
Lake Maintenance
Preserve Monitoring
Preserve Maintenance
Water Monitoring
Reserves
Undesignated Reserves
Total Expenditures

Excess of Revenues Over (Under)
Expenditures

Fund Balance, Beginning of Period

Fund Balance, End of Period

Corkscrew Farms CDD

Statement of Revenues & Expenditures

Total Budget -

General Fund - 001
From 10/1/2016 Through 11/30/2016
(In Whole Numbers)

Current Period

Total Budget

Percent Total
Budget Remaining

Original Actual Variance - Original - Original
(128,567) 0 128,567 (100)%
600,777 0 (600,777) (100)%
472,210 0 (472,210) (100)%
34,000 3,813 30,188 89 %
12,500 0 12,500 100 %
8,000 0 8,000 100 %
5,500 0 5,500 100 %
150 0 150 100 %
2,500 0 2,500 100 %
300 0 300 100 %
260 0 260 100 %
12,500 569 11,931 95 %
15,000 0 15,000 100 %
25,000 0 25,000 100 %
42,000 0 42,000 100 %
300,000 0 300,000 100 %
12,000 0 12,000 100 %
2,500 0 2,500 100 %
472,210 4,381 467,829 99 %
0 (4,381) (4,381) 0%
0 (1,321) (1,321) 0%
0 (5,703) (5,703) 0%
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Revenues
Special Assessments - Capital
Improvements
Capitalized Interest
Debt Service Assessments-Off Roll
Interest Earnings
Interest Earnings
Total Revenues

Expenditures
Debt Service Payments
Interest
Total Expenditures

Excess of Revenues Over (Under)
Expenditures

Fund Balance, Beginning of Period

Fund Balance, End of Period

Total Budget -

Corkscrew Farms CDD

Statement of Revenues & Expenditures

Debt Service Fund - Series 2016 - 200
From 10/1/2016 Through 11/30/2016
(In Whole Numbers)

Current Period

Total Budget

Percent Total
Budget Remaining

Original Actual Variance - Original - Original
122,260 237 (122,023) (100)%
468,231 0 (468,231) (100)%

0 458 458 0%
590,491 695 (589,796) (100)%
590,491 122,260 468,231 79 %
590,491 122,260 468,231 79 %

0 (121,566) (121,566) 0%

0 1,080,948 1,080,948 0%

0 959,382 959,382 0%
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Revenues
Special Assessments - Capital
Improvements
Capitalized Interest
Interest Earnings
Interest Earnings
Total Revenues

Expenditures
Financial & Administrative
Miscellaneous Fees
Total Expenditures

Excess of Revenues Over (Under)
Expenditures

Fund Balance, Beginning of Period

Fund Balance, End of Period

Corkscrew Farms CDD

Statement of Revenues & Expenditures

Capital Project Funds - Series 2016 - 300
From 10/1/2016 Through 11/30/2016

(In Whole Numbers)

Percent Total

Total Budget - Current Period Total Budget Budget Remaining
Original Actual Variance - Original - Original
0 4,161 4,161 0%
0 8,043 8,043 0%
0 12,204 12,204 0%
0 1,250 (1,250) 0%
0 1,250 (1,250) 0%
0 10,954 10,954 0%
0 16,389,362 16,389,362 0%
0 16,400,316 16,400,316 0%
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FCB

FLORIDA COMMUNITY BANK
(866) 764-0006 « www.floridacommunitybank.com
1255 Tamiami Trail, Port Charlotte, FL 33953

Return Service Requested

00001386-0002771-0001-0001-FIMR8006581130164917

CORKSCREW FARMS COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT
2005 PAN AM CIR SUITE 120
TAMPA FL 33607 -2380

Last statement: October 31, 2016
This statement: November 30, 2016
Total days in statement period: 30

Page: 1of 1
XXXXXX
(0)

Direct inquiries to:
Local Branch, 239 437-0025

DEC 09 2016 Florida Community Bank, N.A.
7900 Summerlin Lakes Dr
Fort Myers, FL 33907
Public Funds Checking
Account number ). 9:9.9.9.9.¢4 Beginning balance $1,749.95
Total additions .00
Total subtractions .00
Ending balance $1,749.95

££4200000-(98€ LO000)L LE¥SLOE | LESS008HINIA-LO00-L000- L L£Z000-98E LOOCO

** No activity this statement period **

e
(] H
Thank you for banking with Florida Community Bank, N.A.
Member PLEASE SEE REVERSE SIDE FOR IMPORTANT INFORMATION,

FLORIDA COMMUNITY BANK
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1255 TAMIAMI TRAIL, PORT CHARLOTTE, FL 33953 - TELEPHONE: 1 (866) 764-0006

TEREER
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